el CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O. Box 187  Willard, MO 65781  417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

MEETING AGENDA AND PACKET

BOARD OF ALDERMEN
Regular Meeting

July 8, 2024

6:00 p.m.

Willard City Hall

224 W. Jackson St.

Mayor
Troy Smith

Board Members
Casey Biellier
Jeremy Hill
David Keene
Joyce Lancaster
Scott Swatosh
Carol Wilson

www.cityofwillard.org



s CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda ltem #2

Agenda Amendments/Approval of Agenda

#
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda




CITY OF WILLARD
BOARD OF ALDERMEN
REGULAR MEETING
July 8, 2024
6:00 P.M.

Posted on July 2, 2024, at 10:00 a.m.

Notice is heteby given that the City of Willard, Missouti, Board of Aldermen will conduct a meeting at
6:00 p.m. July 8, 2024, at the Willard City Hall, 224 W. Jackson St., Willard, MO.

The tentative agenda of this meeting includes:
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Call the meeting to ordet.
1. Roll Call
2. Agenda Amendments/Approval of Agenda
3. Oath of Office New Police Officer — Colton Prike
4. Proclamation — Willard Tigers Day — July 19, 2024

5. Comnsent Agenda:
“A Consent Agenda allows the Board of Aldermen to consider and approve routine items of business without
discussion. Any member of the Board of Aldermen, the City Staff or the Public may request removal of any item
from the Consent Agenda and request that it be considered under the Regular Agenda if discussion or debate of
the item is desired. Items not removed from the Consent Agenda will stand approved upon motion by any Board
member, second and unanimous vote to “approve the Consent Agenda as published or modified.”

Minutes from the Regular Meeting June 24, 2024

June/July 2024 Outstanding invoices, checks and draft paid invoices
Department Head Reports

Board Attendance Report

o oe

6. Curtent Outstanding Invoices, Draft and Check Paid Invoices for June/July 2024
7. Citizen Input

8. Mayor Appoint Jeremy Hill to the Board of Alderman

9. Oath of Office Alderman Jeremy Hill

10. Board of Aldetman Appoint Mayot Pro-Tem

11. Appointments to the Planning & Zoning Board

a. Marianne Hill

b. Sam Baird
#
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda Page 1




12. Otdinance Adopting the Tyler Technologies App as a Payment Option for Utility Bills

14.

15.

16.

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

26.

27

Ifyou

. Annual State Statutory Code Updates and Supplementation Process

Consider Proposal to Eliminate the Mayor’s Stipend and Create an Annual Parks
Department Line Item to Support Youth Program Participation and Access

Public Works Well #1: Public Wotks would like the Boatd to consider 2 quotes to teplace
the aging and undersized transformert.

Public Works Building: Public Wotks would like the Board to consider 2 quotes for wiring
and data cable installation in the newly constructed side of the public works building.

414 East Jackson Legal Description Contract for Wilson Surveying

Legal Description Contract for Easements and Roadway for AB Highway Statting at EE
South to Highway 266/Farm Road 91

Ordinance to Amend Chapter 500 — Building Code and Building Regulations of the
Willard Code, by Adopting the International Code Council 2018 Codes as Supplemented
or Amended and the 2017 NEC Code as Supplemented or Amended. (2nd Read)
Discussion

Otrdinance to Add a New Section Titled Commercial Construction, to the Willard Code
of Otdinances Establishing an Ordinance for Regulations and Establishing Facility and
Capacity Fees, in the City of Willard, Missouri. (2nd Read)

Otdinance to Add a New Section Titled Commercial Construction, to the Willard Code
of Ordinances Establishing an Ordinance for Regulation and Establishing Connection
Fees, in the City of Willard. (2nd Read)

Ordinance to Add a New Section Titled Commertcial Construction to the Willard Code of
Ordinances Establishing an Ordinance for Regulation and Establishing Fees for
Commertcial Construction, in the City of Willard, Missouri. (2nd Read)

Ordinance to Amend Section 500.110 Fee Schedule of the Willard Code of Ordinances
in the City of Willard, Missouri. (2nd Read) Discussion

City Administrator Remarks
New Business

Unfinished Business

. Adjourn Meeting

have special needs which require accommodation, please notify the city personnel at City

Hall. Representatives of the news media may obtain copies of this notice by contacting the City
Clerk at 417-742-5302.

Janice Gargus

City Clerk
#

07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda Page 2



el CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0. Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Consent Agenda Item #5

“A Consent Agenda allows the Board of Aldermen to consider and approve routine items of business
without discussion. Any member of the Board of Aldermen, the City Staff or the Public may request
removal of any item from the Consent Agenda and request that it be considered under the Regular Agenda
if discussion or debate of the item is desired. ltems not removed from the Consent Agenda will stand
approved upon motion by any Board member, second and unanimous vote to “approve the Consent
Agenda as published or modified.”

Minutes from the Regular Meeting June 24, 2024

June/July 2024 Outstanding Invoices, Checks and Draft Paid Invoices
Department Head Reports

Board Attendance Report

Lo o

#
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda




] CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781  417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Consent Agenda Item #5a

Minutes from the Regular Meeting June 24, 2024

_____——nm . ———__——
R RssSww—w———S—sSSSSsSs——~——— ™ ——————mm—m—"—"7"7"—"

07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



CITY OF WILLARD
BOARD OF ALDERMEN
REGULAR MEETING
June 24, 2024
6:00 p.m.

Staff present: City Administrator Wes Young, Director of Finance Carolyn Halverson, Police Officer
J.D. Landon, Police Chief Thomas McClain, Director of Parks and Rec Jason Knight, City Clerk Janice
Gargus, Municipal Court Clerk Terry Forshee, City Attorney Nate Dally, Planning and Zoning
Director Mike Reusch, Project Manager Steven Bodenhamer.

Attendees: Burnis Coleman, Mindy Latham, Roscoe Killingsworth, Angie Wilson, Mark Lancaster,
Latry Whitman, Jeremy Hill

The tentative agenda of this meeting includes:
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

Call the meeting to order.
Mayot Sam Baird called the meeting to order at 6:00 p.m.

1. Roll Call
The City Clerk conducted the Roll Call.

Present: Alderman/Mayor Elect Troy Smith, Alderman Casey Biellier, Alderman Keene, Alderman
Joyce Lancastet, Alderman Scott Swatosh, Alderman Carol Wilson, and Mayor Sam Baird

2. Agenda Amendments/Agenda Approval

Mayor Baird said that Item #7 needs to be tabled until the next Board of Alderman meeting. Alderman
David Keene was present at the last meeting, but his name was omitted from the Roll Call and needs
to be amended. Motion was made by Alderman Biellier and seconded by Alderman Lancaster to
amend the agenda to table Item #7 until the next Board of Alderman meeting and to amend the Roll
Call to include Alderman Keene. Motion cattied with a vote of 6-0. Voting aye: Mayor
Elect/Aldermen Smith, Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

3. Mayor Remarks

Mayor Sam Baird gave exiting words in reference to serving as the Interim Mayor and his family
influences for doing so and staying committed through his years of service as an Alderman and Interim
Mayor. He thanked the Boatrd of Aldermen for not only being great to work with, but also for their
supportt during his personal crisis and the loss of his wife. Mayor Baird said all the right people are in
place now to move the City of Willard in the right direction. This includes Mayor Troy Smith, the
curtent Board of Aldermen, the new City Administrator West Young, and the City Clerk, Janice
Gargus. He highly commended the Interim City Administrator, Donna Stewatt, for putting positivity
and the best interest of the City of Willard in place through all the adversity she faced. He credits
Donna for putting all the right people in place including using a recruiter to hire Wes Young. He said
Wes absolutely is the right person to run the City of Willard because his background and expetience
highly qualifies him to bring the change and management the city needs. He also stated that the
Director of Planning & Zoning, Mike Reusch, is another asset for the city and Mike has and will
continue to bring the City of Willard into the 21* Centuty. Mayor Baird encouraged everyone to keep
the best interests of the City of Willard at heart and to remain proactive at working togethet in a

positive manner. He encouraged anyone who might be unhappy with anything to reach out to their
#

06/24/2024 BOA Meeting Minutes Page 1




Alderman and do not turn to social media by posting information that causes anger to grow among
our citizens. He said Facebook, etc., doesn’t allow the truth, as only patt of the issue gets told and
opinions ate formed by those who do not attend Board of Aldermen meetings or seck the entite truth

from their Aldermen.

4. Oath of Office —~ Mayor Troy Smith
City Clerk, Janice Gargus, petformed the Oath of Office of Mayor Troy Smith.

5. Consent Agenda

Motion was made by Alderman Lancaster and seconded by Alderman Biellier to apptrove the Consent Agenda
with the amendments to be made to the meeting minutes of the previous meeting on 6/10/2024. Motion
carried with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye: Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

6. Current Outstanding Invoices, Draft and Check Paid Invoices for May/June 2024.
Discussion/Vote

Mayor Baird asked if anyone had any questions or concerns before approving the financials. Chief
Financial Officer, Carolyn Halverson, answered questions for clarification that did not pose any
concerns. Motion was made by Alderman Biellier and seconded by Alderman Keene to approve the
Current Outstanding Invoices, Draft and Check Paid Invoices for May/June 2024. Motion carried
with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye: Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

7. Oath of Office — Alderman Ward 1 - Jeremy Hill as Appointed by Mayor Troy Smith

This item was tabled until the next meeting as the Aldermen were only made aware of this appointment
tonight and will vote at the next meeting on 7/8/24 and then Jeremy Hill will take the Oath of Office,
if the Board approves the appointment.

8. Proclamation — Willard Tigers Day — June 28, 2024
This item was put off until the next meeting on 7/8/24 as the team was not notified to attend tonight’s

meeting.

9. Citizen Input

Larry Whitman, 508 Pine, thanked the Parks Department for moving the playground equipment from
Jackson Street Patk to the Miller Fatm Park and that it looks so much better now with the
improvement to that park as well. Larty also thanked Mayor Baird for his nine years of service on the
Board of Aldermen and as Interim Mayor. Additionally, Alderman Joyce Lancaster congratulated and
thanked Parks Director, Jason Knight. Jason said thank you goes to the Better Together group.

10. Fireworks Sales Dates/Sutvey Results. Discussion/Vote

City Administrator, Wes Young, went over the results of the citizen survey. Motion was made by
Alderman Keene and seconded by Alderman Wilson to keep the current fireworks dates with no
amendments. Motion carried with a vote of 3-2. Voting aye: Aldermen Keene, Lancaster, and Wilson.
Voting nay: Aldermen Biellier and Swatosh.

11. Orders of Destruction of Court Files Closed in 2017 and 2018. Discussion/Vote

Municipal Court Clerk, Tetry Forshee, discussed the need to eliminate old files due to storage issues
by stating thete are too many files to keep. She said the process will start with destruction of files from
2017 and 2018 and eventually more will be destroyed as well. She stated that it is only the files, and
no evidence is involved because the evidence is held at the Police Department. City Administratot,
Wes Young, asked the City Cletk to put this into a blanket ordinance so it does not have to be voted
on each time files are destroyed. Motion was made by Alderman Lancaster and seconded by Alderman
Biellier to approve the destruction of coutt files for 2017 and 2018 and to put this item into a blanket

#
06/24/2024 BOA Meeting Minutes Page 2




otdinance so the item does not have to be voted on each time files are destroyed. Motion carried with
a vote of 5-0 vote. Voting aye: Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

12. Farm Road 94 Expansion Update. Discussion

Director of Planning & Zoning, Mike Reusch, reiterated his prior discussion comments and details
concerning this issue and stating that the quatry owner has asked to take full responsibility for this
ptoject financially. It was recommended by the Board of Aldermen to get the written contract updated
and signed by all of those involved before releasing approval for the work to statt.

13. Recommendation to Approve WPD Take Home Vehicle Policy. Discussion/Vote

Chief McClain said there are two officers who are interested in taking advantage of this incentive,
possibly a third officer. When asked, he stated that currently there are not enough vehicles for every
officer to have a take home car, however, the cars will be issued by seniotity status. Chief McClain
stated that this is an incentive for the officers, but the officers have to live within a 20-mile radius to
be able to take their car home. Questions were asked concerning the cost of this item and Wes
reiterated that there are no additional costs at this time because there’s enough money in the budget
to cover this currently. Motion was made by Alderman Swatosh and seconded by Alderman Lancaster
to apptove the WPD Take Home Vehicle Policy. Motion carried with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye:
Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancastet, Swatosh, and Wilson.

14. Ordinance Amended 2024 Budget. (2 Read) Discussion/Vote

Catolyn Halverson went over the amended budget lines and totals and explained each of them. Wes
answered questions clarifying that these are projections only and to have a more accurate assumption,
the budget needs to be looked at later in the year. Motion was made by Alderman Biellier and
seconded by Alderman Wilson to approve the Ordinance Amended 2024 Budget. Motion carried
with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye: Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

15. Ordinance to Amend Chapter 500 — Building Code and Building Regulations of the Willard Code,
by Adopting the International Code Council 2018 Codes as Supplemented or Amened and the 2017
NEC Code as Supplemented or Amended (15t Read) Discussion

Ditector of Planning & Zoning, Mike Reusch, explained the impact these fees would have regarding
the city. He answeted questions in complete detail and asked that the Board of Aldermen tread the
ordinance and be prepared to vote at the next meeting. Motion was made by Aldermen Lancaster and
seconded by Alderman Biellier to approve the 1* Read. Motion cattied with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye:
Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

16. Otdinance to Add a New Section Titled Commercial Construction to the Willard Code of
Otdinances Establishing and Ordinance for Regulation and Establishing Connection Fees, in the
City of Willard. (1st Read) Discussion.

Director of Planning & Zoning, Mike Reusch, also explained the impact these fees would have on the
city. He answered questions in complete detail and asked that the Board of Aldermen read the
ordinance and be prepared to vote at the next meeting. Motion was made by Aldermen Keene and
seconded by Alderman Swatosh to approve the 1% Read. Motion carried with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye:
Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

17. Ordinance to Add a New Section Titled Commertcial Construction to the Willard Code of
Ordinances Establishing an Ordinance for Regulations and Establishing Facility and Capacity Fees,
in the City of Willard, Missouri. (1t Read) Discussion

Director of Planning & Zoning, Mike Reusch, also explained the impact these fees would have on the
city. He answered questions in complete detail and asked that the Board of Aldermen read the
ordinance and be prepared to vote at the next meeting. Motion was made by Aldermen Keene and

#
06/24/2024 BOA Meeting Minutes Page 3




seconded by Alderman Biellier to approve the 1* Read. Motion carried with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye:
Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

18. Otdinance to Add a New Section Titled Commercial Construction to the Willard Code of
Ordinances Establishing and Ordinance for Regulations and Establishing Fees for Commercial
Construction in the City of Willard, Missouri. (1°t Read) Discussion
Director of Planning & Zoning, Mike Reusch, also explained the impact these fees would have on the
city. He answered questions in complete detail and asked that the Board of Aldermen read the
ordinance and be prepared to vote at the next meeting. Motion was made by Aldermen Keene and
seconded by Alderman Biellier to approve the 1* Read. Motion carried with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye:
Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

19. Otrdinance to Amend Section 500.110 Fee Schedule of the Willard Code of Ordinances in the City
of Willard, Missouri. (1%t Read) Discussion
Director of Planning & Zoning, Mike Reusch, also explained the impact these fees would have on the
city. He answered questions in complete detail and asked that the Board of Aldermen read the
ordinance and be prepared to vote at the next meeting. The Board recommended adding an option
for “as needed” to the ordinance. Motion was made by Aldermen Keene and seconded by Alderman
Swatosh to approve the 1* Read with the option of “as needed” being added for the 2™ Read at the
next meeting. Motion carried with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye: Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster,
Swatosh, and Wilson.

20. Sanitary Sewer Project
Project Manager, Steven Bodenhamer, gave an update on this project. He explained the status of the project
and stated that there are plans for review in one week.

21. Water Tower Recoating
Project Manager, Steven Bodenhamer, also gave an update on this project including OSHA
requirements and the issue of the cell phone items on top of the tower.

22. City Administrator Remarks

Wes explained that this is a new item on the agenda and will be from this meeting forward. This is an
opportunity for him to give general updates and informasion on various items. He said that 1st Read, and 2nd
Read 1s for clarity on ordinances and that the vote is to take place on the 2d Read. He discussed the benefits
and the possibility of agenda software and video recordings to record the meeting minutes. He said this could
then be uploaded to the website, which Mike and Tammy are working on now to get updated by 2025. He said
the community survey is out for feedback and this will be an annual tool. The current survey deadline is August
31, 2024. He also reminded evetyone that the survey is a public record and folks should not use
hateful language in their submissions. Wes will be at The Hive on July 27 @ 11:00 a.m. for coffee and
citizen input and discussion. He said the OTO — Jackson Street Ovetlay Project could go to bid mid to late
July. In reference to the city sewer challenges, Wes asked engineering consultants he dealt with in the past to
come and meet with him and Public Works Director, Justin Sorgen. The consultants will put their proposal
together and come to a future meeting to present it to the Board.

23. New Business

Mayor Smith requested a wall of mailboxes for everyone, and he was told they already exist and where they can
be found. He also requested that future meeting packets for the night of the meeting be placed in binders with
tabs to eliminate loose papers and the issue of losing track of where the information being discussed is located.
He and Casey said this would be great considering the packets sent via email are a mess with some pages being
turned in the wrong direction and difficult to deal with.

06/24/2024 BOA Meeting Minutes Page 4



24. Old Business
None

25. Adjourn Meeting
Motion was made by Alderman Biellier and seconded by Alderman Lancaster to adjourn the meeting. Motion

catried with a 5-0 vote. Voting aye: Aldermen Biellier, Keene, Lancaster, Swatosh, and Wilson.

Meeting was adjourned at 8:22 p.m.

THE TENTAVIE AGENDA SHOWS THIS MEETING CLOSED PURSUANT TO RSMO SECTION
610.021 #(1) LEGAL

IF YOU HAVE SPECIAL NEEDS WHICH REQUIRE ACCOMODATION, PLEASE NOTIFY THE
CITY PERSONNEL AT CITY HALL. ACCOMODATION WILL BE MADE FOR YOUR NEEDS.
REPRESENTATIVES OF THE NEWS MEDIA MAY OBTAIN COPIES OF THIS NOTICE BY
CONTACTING THE CITY CLERK AT 417-742-5302.

Janice Gargus, City Clerk Troy Smith, Mayor

—
06/24/2024 BOA Meeting Minutes Page 5




el CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W, Jackson Street  P.O.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Consent Agenda Item #5b

June/July 2024 Outstanding

Invoices, Draft and Check Paid Invoices

*
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda




City of Willard, MO

Expense Approval Report 1
By Vendor Name

Post Dates 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Vendor Name Payable Number Post Date Description {Item) Account Number Amount
Vendor: ACS100 - AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES INC
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... T3LL 07/02/2024 TODDLR SWNG 30-800-50177 2332
{PLYGRND,SIDEWLK CHLK,CRD
GAME - PKS
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... T3LL 07/02/2024 TODDLR SWNG 30-800-95500 122.47
(PLYGRND,SIDEWLK CHLK,CRD
GAME - PKS
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... D91G 07/02/2024 VALCRUM ALUMINUM OIL 10-300-71100 41.80
CAPS-STS/W/S
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... D91G 07/02/2024 VALCRUM ALUMINUM OIL 20-600-71100 83.60
CAPS-STS/W/S
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... D91G 07/02/2024 VALCRUM ALUMINUM OIL 20-700-71100 83.60
CAPS-STS/W/S
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... XFGX 07/02/2024 HD SWTCH WATERPROOF 20-600-50130 16.97
RELAY W/LED INDICATOR -W
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... 6VIT 07/02/2024 MAP STORAGE RACK - P&D 10-400-52000 274.00
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... G4Y6 07/02/2024 LAMINATOR SHTS, BASE 30-800-50180 30.97
PLUGS, ALARM CLOCK - PKS
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... G4Y6 07/02/2024 LAMINATOR SHTS, BASE 30-800-50700 20.79
PLUGS, ALARM CLOCK - PKS
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES |... HCRH 07/02/2024 POPCORN, OIL - PKS 30-800-50200 154.60
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... 9 07/02/2024 TONER, BINDERS, DIVIDERS, 10-100-50700 245.03
REPORT COVERS - GEN/CT
AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES I... 9 07/02/2024 TONER, BINDERS, DIVIDERS, 10-250-50700 41.79
REPORT COVERS - GEN/CT
Vendor ACS100 - AMAZON CAPITAL SERVICES INC Total: 1,138.94
Vendor: BVM100 - AMERICAN TRAILER & STORAGE, INC.
AMERICAN TRAILER & STORA... 4 07/02/2024 STORAGE CONTAINER RENTALS 30-800-55850 305.00
- PKS
AMERICAN TRAILER & STORA... 5 07/02/2024 STORAGE CONTAINER RENTAL 30-800-55850 115.00
- PKS
Vendor BVM100 - AMERICAN TRAILER & STORAGE, INC. Total: 420.00
Vendor: APAC100 - APAC CENTRAL, INC
APAC CENTRAL, INC 1972 07/02/2024 COMM SURFACE ASPHALT- 10-300-51000 130.02
STREET PATCHING-STS
Vendor APAC100 - APAC CENTRAL, INC Total: 130.02
Vendor: APM100 - APPLE MARKET
APPLE MARKET 6-25 07/02/2024 FREEDOM FEST WATER - PKS ~ 30-800-50450 108.00
APPLE MARKET 6-25-24 07/02/2024 HOT DOGS, WTR FOR CAMP,  30-800-50177 55.08
WATER FOR FFEST - PKS
APPLE MARKET 6-25-24 07/02/2024 HOT DOGS, WTR FOR CAMP,  30-800-50450 15.00
WATER FOR FFEST - PKS
Vendor APM100 - APPLE MARKET Total: 178.08
Vendor: BWI200 - BULK WASTE LLC d/b/a BWI SANITATION
BULK WASTE LLC d/b/a BWI S... 524-7034 07/02/2024 TOILET RENTAL MILLER PARK - 30-800-55850 239.80
PKS
BULK WASTE LLC d/b/a BWI S... 524-7397 07/02/2024 PORTABLE TOILETS/WASH 30-800-50450 2,050.00
STNS FFEST - PXKS
Vendor BWI200 - BULK WASTE LLC d/b/a BWI SANITATION Total: 2,289.80
Vendor: HVR100 - CAROLYN HALVERSON
CAROLYN HALVERSON 6-20 07/02/2024 REIM PHONE-GEN 10-100-61000 50.00
Vendor HVR100 - CAROLYN HALVERSON Total: 50.00
Vendor: CCG100 - CLEAR CREEK GOLF CAR & VEHICLES LLC
CLEAR CREEK GOLF CAR & VEH..01-196493 07/02/2024 RENTAL OF GOLF CARTS 30-800-50450 795.00
FREEDOM FEST - PKS
7/2/2024 4:44:34 PM Page 1 of 11



Expense Approval Report 1

Vendor Name

CLEAR CREEK GOLF CAR & VEH.

Vendor: COMMGN - COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SERVICES

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...
COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SE...

Payable Number

.6

INV001414901

6-4-24

KN9S

KN9S

6-18
6-18-24

6-18-24

6-18-24

87496

87496

87496

6-19

6-20-24

6-21-24

143176038-001

2502012-0

2502012-0

2502012-0

2502012-0

Vendor: CON170 - CONCO COMPANIES

CONCO COMPANIES

CONCO COMPANIES

7368

7543

Vendor: DAV100 - DAVID DORAN,ATTORNEY AT LAW

DAVID DORAN,ATTORNEY AT ...

4

Vendor: DDG100 - DECKER & DEGOOD

DECKER & DEGOOD

15580

Post Date
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

Description (item)

LABOR & PARTS - PKS

Vendor CCG100 - CLEAR CREEK GOLF CAR & VEHICLES LLC Total:

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Account Number

30-800-71100

KIEFER AQUATICS LIFEGUARD  30-800-50140

TUBE COVERS-PKS

SPFLD NEWS-LEADER
MONTHLY SUBSC-GEN
VISTA PRNT BUS CARDS
YOUNG, NEPHEW - GEN/P&D
VISTA PRNT BUS CARDS
YOUNG, NEPHEW - GEN/P&D
FACEBOOK AD-FFEST-PKS
DLLR GEN TOILET PAPR,CLN
SPLYS, HND SOAP-STS/S/W
DLLR GEN TOILET PAPR,CLN
SPLYS, HND SOAP-STS/S/W
DLLR GEN TOILET PAPR,CLN
SPLYS, HND SOAP-STS/S/W
LOWES LUMBR,CONCRT
ANCHRS,SCRWS-NEW OFFC-
STS/W/S

LOWES LUMBR,CONCRT
ANCHRS,SCRWS-NEW OFFC-
STS/W/S

LOWES LUMBR,CONCRT
ANCHRS,SCRWS-NEW OFFC-
STS/W/S

SUNSHINE LANES BOWLING
FIELD TRIP CAMP - PKS

10-100-55800

10-100-50700

10-400-50700

30-800-55200
10-300-50550

20-600-50550

20-700-50550

10-300-95100

20-600-95100

20-700-95100

30-800-50177

BIS TROPHY STAGE SKIRT FFEST 30-800-50450

- PKS

RECORDER OF DEEDS FINAL
PLAT RECRDNG - P&D
SITEONE STRAW SINGLE NET
SOUTHVW PROI-STS
ADMIRAL EXPRESS COPY
PAPER - GEN/W/S/PKS
ADMIRAL EXPRESS COPY
PAPER - GEN/W/S/PKS
ADMIRAL EXPRESS COPY
PAPER - GEN/W/S/PKS
ADMIRAL EXPRESS COPY
PAPER - GEN/W/S/PKS

10-400-56400

10-300-51000

10-100-50700

20-600-50700

20-700-50700

30-800-50700

SYNOLOGY DATA STRGE DIFF 7 10-100-95500

TO 8 TB-GEN

SMARTSIGN (4) SIGNS-YIELD & 10-300-51000

HEAVY EQPT CRSNG-STS

Vendor COMMGN - COMMERCE CREDIT CARD SERVICES Total:

6"x2" ROCK - SOUTHVIEW ST
PROIJECT - STS

6"x2" ROCK, 1" BASE TYPE 1 -

SOUTHVW PROJ-STS

Vendor CON170 - CONCO COMPANIES Total:

MUNICIPAL JUDGE FEES - CT

Vendor DAV100 - DAVID DORAN,ATTORNEY AT LAW Total:

AUDIT - GEN

Vendor DDG100 - DECKER & DEGOOD Total:

10-300-51000

10-300-51000

10-250-56400

10-100-55400

Amount

848.88
1,643.88

299.00

46.00

31.68

28.68

55.81
9.36

18.72

18.72

152.34

304.69

304.68

82.01

175.00

70.63

143.90

40.23

20.12

20.12

80.45

40.66

389.40

2,332.20

496.37

158.80

655.17

500.00
900.00

1500000

15,000.00




Expense Approval Report 1

Vendor Name Payable Number
Vendor: DNS100 - DNS EQUIPMENT LLC
DNS EQUIPMENT LLC 24-1353

Vendor: DES200 - DOUBLE E SERVICES LLC
DOUBLE E SERVICES LLC 9

Vendor: EDG150 - EDGE SUPPLY
EDGE SUPPLY 2500

Vendor: FED100 - FEDERAL PROTECTION INC
FEDERAL PROTECTION INC BD0179602

Vendor: FRAS55 - FIRST RESPONDER OUTFITTERS, INC
FIRST RESPONDER QUTFITTER... 2

Vendor: GNC100 - GENERAL CODE INC
GENERAL CODE INC 9

Vendor: GOTO100 - GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9
GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC 9

Vendor: GCM100 - GREENE COUNTY TREASURER
GREENE COUNTY TREASURER 1062024

Vendor: JRM100 - JAMES ALLEN REA
JAMES ALLEN REA 6292024

Vendor: JKN100 - JASON KNIGHT

JASON KNIGHT JUN
JASON KNIGHT MAR
JASON KNIGHT MAY

Vendor: JHC100 - JEREMY HILL
JEREMY HILL 6-20-24

JEREMY HILL 4

Vendor: LEG250 - LEGALSHIELD
LEGALSHIELD 4

Post Date

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 -7/2/2024

Description {Item) Account Number

HYPOCHLORITE SOLUTIONS 20-600-50000
FOR WELLS - W

Vendor DNS100 - DNS EQUIPMENT LLC Total:

LABOR, WELDING SPLYS- 10-300-71100

REPAIRS ON JOHN DEERE-STS

Vendor DES200 - DOUBLE E SERVICES LLC Total:

RIDG INTERNAL WRENCH - 20-600-52000
WTR DEPTTOOL - W

Vendor EDG150 - EDGE SUPPLY Total:

QTR SECURITY MONITOR REC  30-800-56450
CTR-PKS

Vendor FED100 - FEDERAL PROTECTION INC Total:

UNIFORM ITEM(S) A. HICKCOX 10-200-92500
ADDTL SPECIAL ORDER-LAW

Vendor FRA555 - FIRST RESPONDER OUTFITTERS, INC Total:

ANNUAL MAINT-GEN 10-100-50700

Vendor GNC100 - GENERAL CODE INC Total:

INTERNET-ALL 10-100-61050
INTERNET-ALL 10-200-61050
INTERNET-ALL 10-250-61050
INTERNET-ALL 10-300-61050
INTERNET-ALL 10-400-61050
INTERNET-ALL 20-600-61050
INTERNET-ALL 20-700-61050
INTERNET-ALL 30-800-61050

Vendor GOTO100 - GOTO COMMUNICATIONS, INC Total:

PREMIERONE MOBILE LICENSE 10-200-57400
2024-LAW

Vendor GCM100 - GREENE COUNTY TREASURER Total:

MUSIC AND ENTERTAINMENT  30-800-50450
FREEDOM FEST - PKS

Vendor JRM100 - JAMES ALLEN REA Total:

30-800-61000
30-800-61000
30-800-61000

REIM PHONE JUN - PKS
REIM PHONE MAR - PKS
REIM PHONE MAY - PKS

Vendor JKN100 - JASON KNIGHT Total:

GRADE AND SIDEWALK WRK  30-800-95500
NEW PLYGRND - PKS
CONCRETE WORK INCLSV
PLYGRND - PKS

30-800-95500

Vendor JHC100 - JEREMY HILL Total:

GROUP INS MCCLAIN & 10-200-93000

SHIPLEY-LAW

Vendor LEG250 - LEGALSHIELD Total:

Amount

1,500.54

1,500.54

1,035.00

1,035.00

92.12

92.12

165.00

165.00

37.98

37.98

1,195.00

1,195.00

117.74
117.74
84.04
86.86
84.04
128.92
128.92
131.74
880.00

919.80

919.80

2,500.00

2,500.00

50.00
50.00
50.00
150.00

7,500.00

2,300.00

9,800.00

29.90

29.90




Expense Approval Report 1

Vendor Name Payable Number
Vendor: LOWS05 - LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES
LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 96646
LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 86006
LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 95682
LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 79349
LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 1

LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 1

LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 1

LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 7

LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 7

LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 7

LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES 9

Vendor: LES100 - LOYD'S ELECTRIC SUPPLY INC
LOYD'S ELECTRIC SUPPLY INC 00

LOYD'S ELECTRIC SUPPLY INC 01

Vendor: MOC100 - MISSOURI ONE CALL SYSTEM, INC
MISSOURI ONE CALL SYSTEM, ...1
MISSOUR! ONE CALL SYSTEM, ...1

Vendor: MOC300 - MOCCFOA
MOCCFOA 1

Vendor: MUA100 - MUNIAID LLC
MUNIAID LLC CE-24-08

Vendor: NFC - NATIONAL FASTENER CORP
NATIONAL FASTENER CORP 6294042
NATIONAL FASTENER CORP 6294042
NATIONAL FASTENER CORP 6294042

Vendor: HYP100 - NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC
NITEL LLC

NN N N N N NN

Post Date

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Description (Item) Account Number Amount
PAINT SUPLYS-PAINT, ROLLERS- 30-800-50500 186.07
PKS
ELECTRCL SUPLYS- 30-800-50450 237.62
BOXES,LIDS, TAPE,GSKTS FFEST-
PKS
ELECTRICAL WIRE FREEDOM  30-800-50450 445.55
FEST - PKS
BOX CVR, BOX EXTNDR, URD  30-800-50450 457.14
CABLE FFEST ELECTRCL-PKS
TREATED POSTS & FENCE 10-300-95100 35.09
PANELS NEW BLDG - STS/S/W
TREATED POSTS & FENCE 20-600-95100 70.19
PANELS NEW BLDG - STS/S/W
TREATED POSTS & FENCE 20-700-95100 70.18
PANELS NEW BLDG - STS/S/W
TREATED LUMBER FOR 10-300-71100 4838
FLATBED TRLR REPR-STS/W/S
TREATED LUMBER FOR 20-600-71100 96.75
FLATBED TRLR REPR-STS/W/S
TREATED LUMBER FOR 20-700-71100 96.76
FLATBED TRLR REPR-STS/W/S
MISC PAINT SPLYS FOR REC 30-800-50500 106.77
CTR - PKS
Vendor LOWS505 - LOWE'S CREDIT SERVICES Total: 1,850.50
PARK ESTATES LS RELAY 20-700-51000 24.36
SWITCHES - S
ELECTRICAL SPLYS MEADWS E  20-700-51000 213.27
LFTSTN-S
Vendor LES100 - LOYD'S ELECTRIC SUPPLY INC Total: 237.63
PROF LOCATE FEES-W/S 20-600-56400 81.00
PROF LOCATE FEES-W/S 20-700-56400 81.00
Vendor MOC100 - MISSOURI ONE CALL SYSTEM, INC Total: 162.00
MML 2024 MSTR ACDMY 10-100-56950 135.00
CLASS J. GARGUS - GEN
Vendor MOC300 - MOCCFOA Total: 135.00
DUES AMERICAN ASSOC OF 10-100-55800 600.00
MUNCPL EXEC FOR CA-GEN
Vendor MUA100 - MUNIAID LLC Total: 600.00
SHOP SPLYS - STS/W/S 10-300-50130 8.66
SHOP SPLYS - STS/W/S 20-600-50130 17.31
SHOP SPLYS - STS/W/S 20-700-50130 17.31
Vendor NFC - NATIONAL FASTENER CORP Total: 43.28
INTERNET-ALL 10-100-61050 297.02
INTERNET-ALL 10-200-61050 297.02
INTERNET-ALL 10-250-61050 212.00
INTERNET-ALL 10-300-61050 219.10
INTERNET-ALL 10-400-61050 212.00
INTERNET-ALL 20-600-61050 325.21
INTERNET-ALL 20-700-61050 325.21
INTERNET-ALL 30-800-61050 332.32

Vendor HYP100 - NITEL LLC Total: 2,219.88




Expense Approval Report 1

Vendor Name Payable Number

Vendor: ORE145 - O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC
O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 2367-161518

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 2367-161518
O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 2367-161518
O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 2367-162738
O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 2367-162738
O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 2367-162738
O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 2367-162814
O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 1902
O'REILLY AUTOMQTIVE, INC 5

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 8

O'REILLY AUTOMOQTIVE, INC 8

O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC 8

Vendor: PAW100 - PEARL AUTO WORKS
PEARL AUTO WORKS 250

Vendor: DOS100 - PETTY CASH - DONA SLATER
PETTY CASH - DONA SLATER 18

Vendor: PIL100 - PILOT WIRELESS LLC
PILOT WIRELESS LLC 5

PILOT WIRELESS LLC
PILOT WIRELESS LLC
PILOT WIRELESS LLC
PILOT WIRELESS LLC
PILOT WIRELESS LLC
PILOT WIRELESS LLC
PILOT WIRELESS LLC

(C T BV U RV I, I Vo )

Vendor: PPS200 - PLAY AND PARK STRUCTURES
PLAY AND PARK STRUCTURES 3

PLAY AND PARK STRUCTURES 8

Vendor: PAS100 - PLAY IT AGAIN SPORTS
PLAY IT AGAIN SPORTS 30019

Vendor: RAC450 - RACE BROS FARM SUPPLY, INC

RACE BROS FARM SUPPLY, INC 764567

Post Date

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Description (Item) Account Number Amount
HEX KEY SET, 1QT-GEAR OIL-92 10-300-71100 6.40
FRD WRK TRK-STS/W/S
HEX KEY SET, 1QT-GEAR OiL-92 20-600-71100 12.79
FRD WRK TRK-STS/W/S
HEX KEY SET, 1QT-GEAR 0iL-92 20-700-71100 12.79
FRD WRK TRK-STS/W/S
1GAL ANTIFREZ, 1QT MOTOR  10-300-71100 4.70
OIL-EQP MAINT-STS/W/S
1GAL ANTIFREZ, 1QT MOTOR  20-600-71100 9.39
OIL-EQP MAINT-STS/W/S
1GAL ANTIFREZ, 1QT MOTOR  20-700-71100 9.39
OIL-EQP MAINT-STS/W/S
OIL FILTER & MOTOR OlL - 10-300-71100 37.82
LAWN MOWER MAINT - STS
LATEX GLOVES-PKS 30-800-50130 22.99
WASHER FLD, BULBS - LAW 10-200-71000 38.13
1 GAL ANTIFREEZE, 1Q MOTOR 10-300-71100 4.70
OIL-STS /W /S
1 GAL ANTIFREEZE, 1Q MOTOR 20-600-71100 9.39
OIL-STS /W /S
1 GAL ANTIFREEZE, 1Q MOTOR 20-700-71100 9.38
OIL-STS /W /S
Vendor ORE14S - O'REILLY AUTOMOTIVE, INC Total: 177.88
REPR '23 DODGE DURANGO -  10-200-71000 2,633.22
LAW
Vendor PAW100 - PEARL AUTO WORKS Total: 2,633.22
104 SWIM MEET FEES AT 30-800-47300 104.00
REPUBLIC - PKS
Vendor DOS100 - PETTY CASH - DONA SLATER Total: 104.00
PHONE-ALL 10-100-61000 87.77
PHONE-ALL 10-200-61000 87.76
PHONE-ALL 10-250-61000 62.68
PHONE-ALL 10-300-61000 62.68
PHONE-ALL 10-400-61000 62.68
PHONE-ALL 20-600-61000 87.76
PHONE-ALL 20-700-61000 87.76
PHONE-ALL 30-800-61000 ] 87.76
Vendor PIL100 - PILOT WIRELESS LLC Total: 626.85
HANDI{CAP PLAYGROUND 30-800-95500 136,568.28
EQUIPMENT - PKS
HANDICAP PLAYGROUND 30-800-95500 1,269.11
EQUIPMENT - PKS -
Vendor PPS200 - PLAY AND PARK STRUCTURES Total: 137,837.39
BASEBLL INDICATRS,BASE 30-800-50180 152.96
PLGS,HOMEPLT, BAT TEES-PKS
Vendor PAS100 - PLAY IT AGAIN SPORTS Total: 152.96
WEED EATR SPD HEAD 10-300-50130 75.95
CVR,NON-IONIC SURFACTANT-
STS

Vendor RAC450 - RACE BROS FARM SUPPLY, INC Total: 75.95




Expense Approval Report 1
Vendor Name Payable Number

Vendor: RIV100 - RANALD IVES CUMMINGS
RANALD IVES CUMMINGS 4

Vendor: REP100 - REPUBLIC PRINTING INC
REPUBLIC PRINTING INC 042843
REPUBLIC PRINTING INC 042843

Vendor: REX380 - REX SMITH OIL CO.
REX SMITH OIL CO. 5

Vendor: LIN200 - ROTA L. STONEHOUSE

ROTA L. STONEHOUSE 062024
ROTA L. STONEHOUSE 062024
ROTA L. STONEHOUSE 062024
ROTA L. STONEHOUSE 062024

Vendor: SGU100 - SAMANTHA GUINN
SAMANTHA GUINN 6-14-24 WALMART

Vendor: SPS150 - SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES

SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544
SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544
SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544
SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544
SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544
SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544
SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544
SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES 1020544

Vendor: SCH175 - SCHULTE SUPPLY, INC.
SCHULTE SUPPLY, INC. $1215710.001

SCHULTE SUPPLY, INC. 02

Vendor: SCU425 - SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES 0041279-IN

Vendor: SPM100 - SPRINGFIELD MOW LLC
SPRINGFIELD MOW LLC 008424

Vendor: SSE100 - SPRINGFIELD STAMP & ENGRAVING
SPRINGFIELD STAMP & ENGR... 3

Post Date

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Description (Item) Account Number

MC SERVICES FREEDOM FEST - 30-800-50450
PKS

Vendor RIV100 - RANALD IVES CUMMINGS Total:

UTILITY BILL ENVELOPES - W/S  20-600-50700
UTILITY BILL ENVELOPES - W/S  20-700-50700

Vendor REP100 - REPUBLIC PRINTING INC Total:

DIESEL FUEL FOR LAGOON 20-700-70100
EQPT-S

Vendor REX380 - REX SMITH OIL CO. Total:

DATA COMPILATION- 10-100-55600
GEN/CT/LAW/PW
DATA COMPILATION-
GEN/CT/LAW/PW
DATA COMPILATION-
GEN/CT/LAW/PW
DATA COMPILATION-
GEN/CT/LAW/PW

10-200-55600

10-250-56400

20-700-55600

Vendor LIN200 - ROTA L. STONEHOUSE Total:

REIM- WALMART 30-800-50170

BALLOONS,RIBBN GRND OPEN

PRK-PKS
Vendor SGU100 - SAMANTHA GUINN Total:

PEST CONTROL-ALL 10-100-50130
PEST CONTROL-ALL 10-200-50130
PEST CONTROL-ALL 10-250-50130
PEST CONTROL-ALL 10-300-50130
PEST CONTROL-ALL 10-400-50130
PEST CONTROL-ALL 20-600-50130
PEST CONTROL-ALL 20-700-50130
PEST CONTROL-ALL 30-800-50130

Vendor SPS150 - SCHENDEL PEST SERVICES Total:

{25) WTR METRS W/GAL 20-600-95500
PROCODR & ITRON CONNCTR-

w

25 NEPTUNE WTR MTERS W/ 20-600-85500

ITRON CONNECTOR - W

Vendor SCH175 - SCHULTE SUPPLY, INC. Total:

DEETER 1247 W/ SELF-SEAL 20-700-50130
COVER 24" CLEAR OPENING-S

Vendor SCU425 - SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES Total:

LABOR & PARTS MOWER 30-800-71100

REPAIR DECK BELT ISSUE - PKS

Vendor SPM100 - SPRINGFIELD MOW LLC Total:

NAME TAGS GARGUS & 10-100-50700

YOUNG, NOTARY STMP - GEN

Vendor SSE100 - SPRINGFIELD STAMP & ENGRAVING Total:

Amount

500.00

500.00

522.00
522.00
1,044.00

860.25

860.25

30.00

15.00

15.00

30.00

90.00

18.00

18.00

25.00
35.00
5.00
10.00
5.00
30.00
30.00
40.00
180.00

7,400.00

7,400.00

14,800.00

394.00

394.00

815.67

815.67

44.40

44.40




Expense Approval Report 1

Vendor Name Payable Number

Post Date

Vendor: SPR200 - SPRINGFIELD-GREENE COUNTY HEALTH DEPARTMENT

SPRINGFIELD-GREENE COUNTY..WILLARD-060424

Vendor: SBR100 - SUNBELT RENTALS INC
SUNBELT RENTALS INC 38

Vendor: TRH100 - TREVOR HOFFMAN

TREVOR HOFFMAN JUN
TREVOR HOFFMAN JUN
TREVOR HOFFMAN JUN

Vendor: WSP100 - TURN 2 APPAREL LLC
TURN 2 APPAREL LLC 12281
TURN 2 APPAREL LLC 12401

Vendor: TYL100 - TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC
TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 025-467793

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 025-469300

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 4

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 4

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 4

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 4

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 4

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 4

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 4

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 8

TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC 8

Vendor: UMB100 - UMB BANK

UMB BANK 6-12-24
UMB BANK 6-12-24
UMB BANK 80

Vendor: USA400 - USA BLUE BOOK
USA BLUE BOOK INV00383504

Vendor: VER100 - VERIZON WIRELESS

VERIZON WIRELESS 48
VERIZON WIRELESS 48
VERIZON WIRELESS 48

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Description (Item) Account Number

WATER TESTS-W 20-600-50200

Vendor SPR200 - SPRINGFIELD-GREENE COUNTY HEALTH DEPARTMENT Total:

LIGHT POLE RENTALS 30-800-50450
FREEDOM FEST - PKS

Vendor SBR100 - SUNBELT RENTALS INC Total:

REIM CELL PHONE JUN - 10-300-61000
STS/W/S
REIM CELL PHONE JUN - 20-600-61000
STS/W/S
REIM CELL PHONE JUN - 20-700-61000
STS/W/S

Vendor TRH100 - TREVOR HOFFMAN Total:

BASEBALL SPORTS SHIRTS - PKS 30-800-50150
BASEBALL SHIRTS - PKS 30-800-50150

Vendor WSP100 - TURN 2 APPAREL LLC Total:

TIME & ATTEND MEETNGS W/ 10-100-95500
KRISTIN, MINDY - GEN

TIME & ATTEND MEETNGS W/ 10-100-95500
MINDY - GEN

TIME/ATTNDNC LIC & SUBSC ~ 10-100-57400
YR 1UL 2024-JUN 2025 -ALL

TIME/ATTNDNC LIC & SUBSC ~ 10-200-57400
YR JUL 2024-JUN 2025 -ALL

TIME/ATTNDNC LIC & SUBSC ~ 10-250-57400
YR JUL 2024-JUN 2025 -ALL

TIME/ATTNDNC LIC & SUBSC ~ 10-400-57400
YR JUL 2024-JUN 2025 -ALL

TIME/ATTNDNC LIC & SUBSC ~ 20-600-57400
YR JUL 2024-JUN 2025 -ALL

TIME/ATTNDNC LIC & SUBSC ~ 20-700-57400
YR JUL 2024-JUN 2025 -ALL

TIME/ATTNDNC LIC & SUBSC ~ 30-800-57400
YR JUL 2024-JUN 2025 -ALL

UTIL BILLING NOTIFICATIONS-  20-600-57400
W/s

UTIL BILLING NOTIFICATIONS-  20-700-57400
W/S

Vendor TYL100 - TYLER TECHNOLOGIES INC Total:

SERIES 2014 COP INTRST - W/S 20-600-96200
SERIES 2014 COP INTRST - W/S 20-700-96200
SERIES 2015 FISCAL AGENT 30-800-96400
FEES - PKS

Vendor UMB100 - UMB BANK Total:

REPLACEMENT HANDLE FOR  20-600-50130
HYDRANT GATE VLVE-W

Vendor USA400 - USA BLUE BOOK Total:

INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 10-100-61050
EQUIP - ALL
INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 10-200-61000
EQUIP - ALL
INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 10-200-61050

EQUIP - ALL

Amount

117.00
117.00

467.80

467.80

10.00

20.00

20.00

50.00

532.00
36.60
568.60

1,015.00

2,610.00

968.10

145.22

145.22

145.22

1,645.75

1,645.77

145.22

40.90

40.90

8,547.30

6,015.73
6,015.74
750.00

12,781.47

49.50

49.50

80.02

121.14

160.04




Expense Approval Report 1

Vendor Name Payable Number
VERIZON WIRELESS 48
VERIZON WIRELESS 48
VERIZON WIRELESS 48
VERIZON WIRELESS 48
VERIZON WIRELESS 48
VERIZON WIRELESS 48

Vendor: AMK100 - VESTIS

VESTIS 41702494396
VESTIS 4170249496
VESTIS 4170249436
VESTIS 4170251452
VESTIS 4170251452
VESTIS 4170251452
VESTIS 85
VESTIS 85
VESTIS 85

Vendor: WAL110 - WALMART CAPITAL ONE
WALMART CAPITAL ONE 6-18-24

WALMART CAPITAL ONE 6-19-24

Vendor: WRI110 - WEX BANK

WEX BANK 97796020
WEX BANK 97796020
WEX BANK 97796020
WEX BANK 97796020
WEX BANK 97796020
WEX BANK 97796020
WEX BANK 97796020

Vendor: WTV100 - WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC ~ B259054
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC ~ D102863
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC ~ D102972

WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC  B261429

Post Date
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Description (Item) Account Number

INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 10-300-61000
EQUIP - ALL
INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 10-400-61000
EQUIP - ALL
INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 20-600-61000
EQUIP - ALL
INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 20-700-61000
EQUIP - ALL
INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 30-800-61000
EQUIP - ALL
INTERNET/CELL PHONES, 30-800-61050
EQUIP - ALL

Vendor VER100 - VERIZON WIRELESS Total:

PUBLIC WRKS UNIFORM 10-300-92500
SERVICE-STS/W /S
PUBLIC WRKS UNIFORM 20-600-92500
SERVICE-STS/W /S
PUBLIC WRKS UNIFORM 20-700-92500

SERVICE-STS /W /S

PUBLIC WRKS DEPT UNIFORM  10-300-92500
SERV - STS/ W/ S

PUBLIC WRKS DEPT UNIFORM  20-600-92500
SERV - STS/ W/ S

PUBLIC WRKS DEPT UNIFORM  20-700-92500
SERV - STS/ W/ S

PUBLIC WRKS DEPT UNIFORM  10-300-92500
SERV - STS/ W/ S

PUBLIC WRKS DEPT UNIFORM  20-600-92500
SERV - STS/ W/ S

PUBLIC WRKS DEPT UNIFORM  20-700-92500
SERV - STS/ W/ S

Vendor AMK100 - VESTIS Total:

SAMS CONCESSIONS, CUPS, 30-800-50200
BAGS, LAUNDRY DET - PKS
SAMS CONCESSIONS - PKS 30-800-50200
Vendor WAL110 - WALMART CAPITAL ONE Total:

VEH AND EQUIP FUEL- 10-200-70000
LAW/PKS/STS/W/S/P&D
VEH AND EQUIP FUEL- 10-300-70000
LAW/PKS/STS/W/S/P&D
VEH AND EQUIP FUEL- 10-400-70000
LAW/PKS/STS/W/S/P&D
VEH AND EQUIP FUEL- 20-600-70000
LAW/PKS/STS/W/S/P&D
VEH AND EQUIP FUEL- 20-700-70000
LAW/PKS/STS/W/S/P&D
VEH AND EQUIP FUEL- 30-800-70000
LAW/PKS/STS/W/S/P&D
VEH AND EQU!IP FUEL- 30-800-70100
LAW/PKS/STS/W/S/P&D

Vendor WRI110 - WEX BANK Total:

LUMBER FOR PAVILION-PKS 30-800-50500
FLOWERS - PKS 30-800-50110
TRAY SET,TRAY LNRS,CVRS,PNT 30-800-50500
MIXR REC CTR - PKS
PAINT CUPS, BRSHS, TRAY 30-800-50500
LNRS REC CTR - PKS

Amount

16.07

40.38

32.16

32.16

85.76

40.01

607.74

26.82

53.65

53.65

26.82

53.65

53.65

26.65

53.31

53.30

401.50

744.30

842.44
1,586.74

1,720.23

519.57

75.30

1,066.91

1,066.91

625.11

1,203.83

6,277.86

22.38
27.93
24.05

34.68




Expense Approval Report 1
Vendor Name

WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC

WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC

WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC
WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC

WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC

Payable Number
B263543

D106164
B263611
B263763
D106457
B264026
B264042
B264043

B264077
B264086

B264096
B264190
B264190
D106622
D106625
B264355
B264355
B264355
10

24

Post Date
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024
07/02/2024

07/02/2024

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024

Description (ltem) Account Number Amount

1/2" WHT MPT PLUG - 20-700-51000 8.24

LAGOON REPR - S

55 GAL BAGS, 45 GALBAGS-  10-300-50130 30.86

DEAD ANIMAL REMVL-5TS

BASEBLL RAKES,TOOL BOX,BUG 30-800-50180 101.12

CONTRL,PNT PADLS-PKS

READY-MIX W/ GRAVEL TENT  30-800-50450 40.90

WEIGHTS FFEST - PKS

GLUE FOR BASEBOARDS REC  30-800-50500 18.84

CENTER - PKS

SCREWDRVRS,MISC TOOL,MISC 30-800-50450 18.30

BOLTS FFEST ELECTRC-PKS

WING CONNCTRS,QUTLET 30-800-50450 19.33

ELECTRICAL FFEST-PKS

ELECTRICAL CONNECTORS 30-800-50450 23.83

FREEDOM FEST - PKS

48"x84" WINDOW SCREEN -S  20-700-51000 10.34

LANDSCAPE SEED, TURF 10-300-51000 415.79

SPREADR-SOUTHVW PROJ-STS

STRAW BALES - SOUTHVIEW  10-300-51000 41.34

PROJECT - STS

OUTLET CVRS ELECRCL FFEST, 30-800-50450 31.92

MOUSE TRAPS - PKS

OUTLET CVRS ELECRCL FFEST,  30-800-50700 11.86

MOUSE TRAPS - PKS

REMCO PROF GRD PUMP FOR  30-800-52000 75.99

WEED CONTROL - PKS

COUPLNGS, PVC PIPE-LONE 20-600-51000 26.67

OAK LEAK-W

WHT ENAMEL PNT & BRSHS-  10-300-95100 13.82

FENCE NEW BLDG-STS/S/W

WHT ENAMEL PNT & BRSHS-  20-600-95100 27.63

FENCE NEW BLDG-STS/S/W

WHT ENAMEL PNT & BRSHS-  20-700-95100 27.64

FENCE NEW BLDG-STS/S/W

UPS SHIPPING CHARGE FOR  20-600-51000 23.62

PUMP REPR - W

FUSES FOR TRUCK - PKS 30-800-71000 26.99
Vendor WTV100 - WILLARD HOME CENTER LLC Total: 1,104.07

Grand Total: 241,205.87




Expense Approval Report 1

Fund Summary

Fund
10 - GENERAL FUND
20 - WATER AND SEWER FUND
30 - PARKS FUND
Grand Tatal:

Account Summary

Account Number Account Name
10-100-50130 SUPPLIES-GCG
10-100-50700 OFFICE SUPPLIES-GCG
10-100-55400 AUDIT EXPENSE-GCG
10-100-55600 CONTRACT LABOR-GCG
10-100-55800 DUES AND SUBSCRIPTIO...
10-100-56950 TRAINING & EDUCATION...
10-100-57400 EQUIPMENT/SOFTWARE...
10-100-61000 TELEPHONE-GCG
10-100-61050 INTERNET-GCG
10-100-95500 CAPITAL ASSET EXP EQU...
10-200-50130 SUPPLIES-LAW
10-200-55600 CONTRACT LABOR-LAW
10-200-57400 EQUIPMENT/SOFTWARE...
10-200-61000 TELEPHONE-LAW
10-200-61050 INTERNET-LAW
10-200-70000 VEHICLE EXPENSES FUEL...
10-200-71000 VEHICLE REPAIR & MAIN...
10-200-92500 UNIFORMS-LAW
10-200-93000 GROUP INSURANCE-LAW
10-250-50130 SUPPLIES-COURT
10-250-50700 OFFICE SUPPLIES-COURT
10-250-56400 PROFESSIONAL-COURT
10-250-57400 EQUIP/SOFTWARE CON...
10-250-61000 TELEPHONE-COURT
10-250-61050 INTERNET-COURT
10-300-50130 SUPPLIES-STREETS
10-300-50550 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES-ST...
10-300-51000 REPAIRS AND MAINTEN...
10-300-61000 TELEPHONE-STREETS
10-300-61050 INTERNET-STREETS
10-300-70000 VEHICLE EXPENSE FUEL-...
10-300-71100 EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
10-300-92500 UNIFORMS-STREETS
10-300-95100 CAPITAL ASSET EXP-STR...
10-400-50130 SUPPLIES-P&D
10-400-50700 OFFICE SUPPLIES-P&D
10-400-52000 SUPPLIES-SMALL EQUIP...
10-400-56400 PROFESSIONAL-P&D
10-400-57400 EQUIPMENT/SOFTWARE...
10-400-61000 TELEPHONE-P&D
10-400-61050 INTERNET-P&D
10-400-70000 VEHICLE EXPENSE FUEL-...
20-600-50000 CHEMICALS-WATER
20-600-50130 SUPPLIES-WATER
20-600-50200 LABORATORY FEES-WAT...
20-600-50550 CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES-W...
20-600-50700 OFFICE SUPPLIES-WATER
20-600-51000 REPAIRS AND MAINTEN...
20-600-52000 SUPPLIES SMALL EQUIP...

20-600-56400 PROFESSIONAL-WATER

Expense Amount
35,765.56
39,821.96

165,618.35

241,205.87

Expense Amount
25.00
1,556.34
15,000.00
30.00
646.00
135.00
968.10
137.77
494.78
3,665.66
35.00
15.00
1,065.02
208.90
574.80
1,720.23
2,671.35
37.98
29.90
5.00
41.79
915.00
145.22
62.68
296.04
125.47
9.36
1,775.62
88.75
305.96
519.57
1,178.80
80.29
201.25
5.00
28.68
274.00
70.63
145.22
103.06
296.04
75.30
1,500.54
113.78
117.00
18.72
542.12
50.29
92.12
81.00

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 -7/2/2024
Report Summary




Expense Approval Report 1

Account Number
20-600-57400
20-600-61000
20-600-61050
20-600-70000
20-600-71100
20-600-92500
20-600-95100
20-600-95500
20-600-96200
20-700-50130
20-700-50550
20-700-50700
20-700-51000
20-700-55600
20-700-56400
20-700-57400
20-700-61000
20-700-61050
20-700-70000
20-700-70100
20-700-71100
20-700-92500
20-700-95100
20-700-96200
30-800-47300
30-800-50110
30-800-50130
30-800-50140
30-800-50150
30-800-50170
30-800-50177
30-800-50180
30-800-50200
30-800-50450
30-800-50500
30-800-50700
30-800-52000
30-800-55200
30-800-55850
30-800-56450
30-800-57400
30-800-61000
30-800-61050
30-800-70000
30-800-70100
30-800-71000
30-800-71100
30-800-95500
30-800-96400

Project Account Key

**NOnett
2070095500-13
308009550011

Account Summary

Account Name

EQUIPMENT/SOFTWARE...

TELEPHONE WATER
INTERNET-WATER
VEHICLE EXPENSE FUEL...
EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
UNIFORMS-WATER
CAPITAL ASSET EXP-WA...
CAPITAL ASSET EXP EQU...

INTEREST EXPENSE-WAT...

SUPPLIES-SEWER
CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES-S...
OFFICE SUPPLIES-SEWER
REPAIRS AND MAINTEN...
CONTRACT LABOR-SEW...
PROFESSIONAL-SEWER

EQUIPMENT/SOFTWARE...

TELEPHONE-SEWER
INTERNET-SEWER
VEHICLE EXPENSE FUEL-...
EQUIPMENT FUEL-SEWER
EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...
UNIFORMS-SEWER

CAPITAL ASSET EXP-SEW...

INTEREST EXPENSE-SEW...
YOUTH SPORTS-PKS
SUPPLIES - GROUNDS
SUPPLIES GENERAL-PKS
SUPPLIES-AQUATIC

SUPPLIES-SPORTS SHIRTS..

SUPPLIES SPECIAL ACTIV...
SUPPLIES-YOUTH CAMP
SUPPLIES SPORTS-PKS
CONCESSIONS-PKS
FREEDOM FEST EXPENSE

BUILDING MAINTENANC...

OFFICE SUPPLIES-PKS
SUPPLIES SMALL EQUIP...
ADVERTISING-PKS
EQUIPMENT RENTAL-PKS
CONTRACT SERVICES/SE...

EQUIPMENT/SOFTWARE...

TELEPHONE-PKS
INTERNET-PARKS
VEHICLE EXPENSE FUEL-...
EQUIPMENT FUEL-PKS

VEHICLE REPAIR & MAIN...

EQUIPMENT REPAIR & ...

CAPITAL ASSET EXP EQU...

FISCAL AGENT FEES
Grand Total:

Project Account Summary

Grand Total:

Expense Amount
1,686.65
139.92
454.13
1,066.91
211.92
160.61
402.51
14,800.00
6,015.73
441.31
18.72
542.12
256.21
30.00
81.00
1,686.67
139.92
454.13
1,066.91
860.25
211.93
160.60
402.50
6,015.74
104.00
27.93
62.99
299.00
568.60
18.00
160.41
285.05
1,741.34
7,885.39
392.79
113.10
75.99
55.81
659.80
165.00
145.22
323.52
504.07
625.11
1,203.83
26.99
1,664.55
147,759.86
750.00
241,205.87

Expense Amount
92,439.75
1,006.26

147,759.86

241,205.87

Post Dates: 6/25/2024 - 7/2/2024




e CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Consent Agenda Item #5c¢

Department Head Reports

_— . -
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



CITY OF WILLARD
BOARD OF ALDERMEN
JUNE 2024

City Clerk Report

1. I’'m working with City Administrator, Wes Young, to streamline the deadline dates for tentative
agenda items and meeting packet items.

2. Per Mayor Smith’s request, | will be putting meeting packets in binders helping to keep items
organized for more efficient accessibility during the meeting. Meeting binders are NOT to be
taken home by BOA members. The packets will have to be removed from the binders and the
binders left in the meeting room to be used at the next meeting.

3. I'm continuing to work on keeping up with Business License applications.

4. |renewed all but one liquor license on file, and that business has not presented their State
Liquor License so that | can issue their City Liquor License. Due to exclusion of the form of
punishment for this violation in the ordinance, nothing has been done to enforce this business
to comply.

5. I’'m working to clean out file cabinets in my immediate office and combining older files with the
files in the closet.

6. |registered to attend one day of the MML Annual Conference on September 15, 2024, which is
being held in Branson this year. The information on this day is directed to City Clerks.

Janice Gargus



HUMAN RESOURCES
MONTHLY REPORT
JUNE 2024

The Human Resources department has been very busy this past month. | have been working closely
with Tyler Technologies to get the new time and attendance software, ExecuTime, working correctly.
| have been on several web meetings with our consultant, Mindy Peacha. We ran two test pilots last
month to identify problems. We have had issues with the new timeclocks, but it appears these have
been resolved as of Friday, June 28, and the clocks are functioning properly at this time. We are in
the process of comparing our old timekeeping software with the new to make sure nothing is falling
through the cracks, and that all employee clock punches are being recorded. | am stillin the
process of getting all employees’ fingerprints scanned into the new clocks. Our next payrollin two
weeks will be imported from the new software. Our contract with the existing software, TimeForce,
will expire as of July 1. Other than the timeclock problems everything seems to be working well.
Some training with department heads and supervisors is still needed and hopefully will be
completed in the next week.

The summer season is in full swing. We had several seasonal employees return from last year. This
reduced the number of people that had to come to City Hall to complete new hire paperwork which
helped to reduce foot traffic.

The shift differentials for the police department began June 10.

Several salaried employees have been changed to hourly based on the new rules put out by the Fair
Labor Standards board. This change took affect June 23. Most department heads are still salaried
employees.

Dona Slater



MUNICIPAL DIVISION SUMMARY REPORTING FORM

Refer to Instructions for directions and term definitions. Complete a report each month even if there has not been any court activity.

|. COURT INFORMATION Municipality; WILLARD Reporting Period: Jun 1, 2024 - Jun 28, 2024
Mailing Address: 224 W JACKSON ST, WILLARD, MO 65781
Physical Address: 224 W JACKSON ST, WILLARD, MO 65781 County: Greene County Circuit: 31
Telephone Number: Fax Number:
Prepared by: Terry Forshee E-mail Address:
Municipal Judge: DAVID W. DORAN
L MONTHLY CASELOAD INFORMATION Alcohol & Drug Other Non.-Traffic
Related Traffic | Traffic [ Ordinance
A. Cases (citations/informations) pending at start of month 10 321 82
B. Cases (citations/informations) filed 2 59 3
C. Cases (citations/informations) disposed
1. jury trial (Springfield, Jefferson County, and St. Louis County only) 0 0 0
2. court/bench trial - GUILTY 0 0 0
3. court/bench trial - NOT GUILTY 0 0 0
4, plea of GUILTY in court 1 45 12
5. Viplations Bureau Citations (i.e. written plea of guilty) and bond 0 12 0
forfeiture by court order (as payment of fines/costs)
6. dismissed by court 0 0] 0
7. nolle prosequi 0] 8 0
8. certified for jury trial (not heard in Municipal Division) 0 0 0
9. TOTAL CASE DISPOSITIONS 1 65 12
D. Cases (citations/informations) pending at end of month [pending 1 315 73
caseload = (A+B)-C9]
E. Trial de Novo and/or appeal applications filed 0 0 0
1ll. WARRANT INFORMATION (pre- & post-disposition) | [V. PARKING TICKETS
1. # Issued durlng reporting period 36 1. # Issued during period 0
2. # Served/withdrawn during reporting period 15 [{ Court staff does not process parking tickets
3. # Outstanding at end of reporting period 322

Office of State Courts Administrator, Statistics, 2112 \ndustrial Drive, P.O. Box 104480, Jefferson City, MO

Fax: 573-526-0338

OSCA Help Desk: 1-888-541-4894
Page 1 of 2

mail; i

65110
R

Revised July 2016



MUNICIPAL DIVISION SUMMARY REPORTING FORM

COURT INFORMATION Municipality: WILLARD Reporting Period: Jun 1, 2024 - Jun 28, 2024
V. DISBURSEMENTS
. . - Other Disbursements:Enter below additional surcharges
Exc_ess Rev.enue_ (minor tr'aff|c and municipal and/or fees not listed above. Designate if subject to the
ordinance violations, subject to the excess revenue e 3 .
ercentage limitation) excess revenue percentage limitation, Examples include,
P g but are not limited to, arrest costs and witness fees.
Fines - Excess Revenue $2,774.00 | Court Automation $329.00
Clerk Fee - Excess Revenue $341.00 | Judicial Facility Srchg CT31 $470.00
Crime Victims Compensation (CVC) Fund $11.47 Law Enf Arrest Costs-E/R $87.87
surcharge - Paid to City/Excess Revenue :
Law Enf Arrest-Local $477.27
Bond forfeitures (paid to city) - Excess
Revenue b y) $0.00 | overpayment $0.50
Total Excess Revenue $3,126.47 Overpayment-E/R $1.81
Other Revenue (non-minor traffic and ordinance Overpayments Detail Code $16.00
violations, nf)t -sub_ject to the excess revenue Total Other Disbursements $1,382.45
percentage limitation)
. Total Disbursements of Costs, Fees,
Fines - Other $1,709.50 Surcharges and Bonds Forfeited $6,923.45
Clerk Fee - Other $176.00 Bond Refunds $0.00
Judicial Education Fund (JEF) N
[J court does not retain funds for JEF $47.00 | Total Disbursements R
Peace Officer Standards and Training $47.00
(POST) Commission surcharge ;
Crime Victims Compensation
(CVC) Fund surcharge - Paid to $335.11
State
Crime Victims Compensation (CVC) Fund $5.92
surcharge - Paid to City/Other )
Law Enforcement Training (LET) Fund
surcharge $94.00
Domestic Violence Shelter surcharge $0.00
Inmate Prisoner Detainee Security Fund $0.00
surcharge ;
Restitution $0.00
Parking ticket revenue (including penalties) $0.00
Bond forfeitures (paid to city) - Other $0.00
Total Other Revenue $2,414.53
Office of State Courts Administrator, Statistics, 2112 Industrial Drive, P.O. Box 104480, Jefferson City, MO 65110
OSCA Help Desk: 1-888-541-4894 Fax: 573-526-0338 Email: MunicipaiDivision Reporis@courts.mo.qov
Revised July 2016

Page 2 of 2



Park Director’s Report —July 2024

Quote of the Month:
“There is only one way to avoid criticism. Do nothing. Be nothing. Say nothing.” —Aristotle

Aquatic Center
The Aquatic Center continues to perform exceptionally well this month, with an increase in attendance

and positive feedback from the community. The hot summer days have driven more visitors to seek out
the aquatic center's refreshing offerings, contributing to a successful season. Overall, revenue is up more
than $8,000 to date from last year.

Summer Camps
With summer school out, we anticipate a significant increase in attendance for our summer camps. The

extended break provides a perfect opportunity for children to engage in our diverse array of camp
activities, promising a lively and enriching experience for all participants. The camp thoroughly enjoyed
their visit to “Camp Character”- the hidden gem of the PAL Program- and it has been the most popular
field trip this summer.

Summer Baseball

Summer baseball is in full swing, with games and practices keeping our fields busy. Participation rates are
strong, and the community's support for the program is strong. We are currently in a rebuilding period
with our sports programs, having some consistency in leadership after several years of “one and done”
sports coordinators. The community support for the parks and rec “recreation” level programs continues

to be strong.

Better Together Playground

The grand opening of the Better Together Playground wasJune 15™. The playground has now been open
for a couple of weeks and has quickly become a popular destination. The heavy foot traffic underscores
the community's appreciation for the new space, which offers a fun and safe environment for children

and families.

Jackson St Park —Freedom Fest Preparation

A special commendation goes out to the entire parks team for their swift and efficient turnaround in
preparing Jackson St Park for the Freedom Fest Event. The maintenance team, in particular, deserves
recognition for their diligent work in preparing the electrical systems for the festivities. Their efforts
ensured a seamless and enjoyable experience for all attendees.

Freedom Fest Success

Freedom Fest was a success, drawing a substantial crowd despite the heat advisory and the threat of
severe weather. Aithough overall attendance was lower than in previous years, the event was still well-
received by those who attended. The primary reason for the lower turnout was the earlier-than-
scheduled fireworks display. Many community members typically arrive just for the fireworks, and the
schedule change impacted their attendance.




Fireworks Timing and Safety Concerns

There was some negative feedback about the timing and communication regarding the decision to shoot
the fireworks earlier than planned. These were largely due to the minimal advance notice, and lack of
clear communication to those planning to arrive only for the fireworks show. The call to shoot early was
made due to safety concerns for those already in the park. With lightning detected in the immediate
area and the forecast for worsening lightning, the priority was ensuring the safety of those already
present in the park. Although this decision affected attendance and resulted in negative feedback, it was
the correct decision to protect our community from potential harm.

Overall, this month has been marked by successful events, high engagement in our programs, anda
strong sense of community. | continue to extend my gratitude to all staff members for their hard work
and dedication. Their commitment to excellence continues to make Willard Parks a highlight of our
community.



e CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O, Box 187" Willard, MO 65781  417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Planning Department Report

July 2024
Permits - June
Permits Fees Est. Value of Permits Fees Est.
Issued | collected Work Issued Collected Value of Work
(April) (April) (YtD) (YtD) (YtD)
18 $17935.00 | $1,020,042.00 162 $291,364.00 | $20,062,191.00

Sunshine requests included the US Census, Data Dodge Analytics, and Build-zoom

Current Development

Hoffman Hills: Phase 1 multiple lots have been sold and building permits have been submitted.
Multiple buildings are under construction

Hoffman Hills Phase I1: Subdivision has been inspected and Final Plat is going to the Planning
Commission July 16 2024

West Ridge: There is only 1 open building permit remaining. The silo has been painted and
finished. The builder is responsible for setting up the HOA, if they do not then they will remain
the liable party for maintenance of common spaces and stormwater.

Stone Creek: Flint Rock has received multiple building permits for homes in the new
subdivision. Multiple homes under construction

Generations Village: All building permits have been issued. They have started excavating.
Rocky Point: Has Preliminary plat. Working on construction drawings and utility
installation.

Mike Ruesch

Director of Planning and Development
417-742-5310



Other Business

1. Mixed use code revised going to PC July 16

2. Working on going paperless for all building submittals & online applications. Added
online payment and online applications.

3. PCis reviewing the 160 overlay requirements to PC for review. This details the
development requirements for new projects along the 160 corridors.

4, Will submit the sign ordinance and variance codes to accommodate school signage to PC
in July

5. Revise animal code going to PC on July 16

6. Looking for input on the downtown overlay, if you have ideas and suggestions please
get with staff.

Mike Ruesch

Director of Planning and Development
417-742-5310



Willard Police Department
June 2024 - Monthly Statistical Report

Administration Officer — DSN Case #'s
Tom McClain, Chief 1601-001 1
Shannon Shipley, Asst. Chief 1602-003 12
Total 13
Squad #1 | 1607-050 Caleb Steen, Cpl. 16 | Squad#2 | 1603-027 Steve Purdy, Sgt. 25
1605-056 Mark Cole, Cpl. 17 1608-054 Stefan Collette, Cpl. 18
1611-064 Danielle Cale, Officer 19 1610-061 Christian Smith, Officer 58
1604-065 | Anthony Hickox, Officer 6 1606-066 Colton Prike, Officer 23
Total 58 Total 124
Reserves Officer Officer Names Case #'s Hours
1609-063 Cody Weatherford, PT Officer 21 109.5
1644-057 Matthew Hanson, PT Officer 17.5
1641-014 Brian Gordon, Reserve 18.75
1642-015 JD Landon, Reserve 18.5
1645-047 Glenn Cozzens, Reserve 0
1646-031 Andrew Hunt, Reserve 0
1643-048 Tim Wheeler, Reserve 0
Total 21
Total Incidents for the month... 216
Incident Statistics
Felony 6 HBO (Handled by Officers) 95
Misdemeanor 3 Use of Force 0
Infraction 90 Dog at Large 0
Other (Services) 117 Neglect-0 /Abuse-0 /Bites-0 0
Vehicle Maintenance
Vehicle Odometer Monthly Shifts Used Miles per Monthly Year to Date
Reading Mileage Shift Maintenance | Maintenance
WPD-01 2021 Ford F-150 32,277 730 19 38 0
WPD-02 2021 Charger 64,783 1,500 14 107 137.49 221.99
WPD-04 2023 Durango 19,959 1,241 13 95 76.49
WPD-05 2023 Charger 19,955 2,754 28 98 137.49 352.47
WPD-06 2023 Durango 11,135 2,062 23 90 107.49
WPD-07 2017 Explorer 28,399 712 14 51 1,104.12
WPD-08 2008 Harley 6,215 140 4 35 95.73

Monthly Vehicle Maintenance Details

WPD-01.

WPD-05: oil change; tire rotation; air filter

WPD-02: oil change; tire rotation; air filter

WPD-06:

WPD-04:

WPD-07:




Public Works Report
June 2024

Work Orders 114
Locates 135
Rereads 56
Shut Offs 34
Meter Changes 9

Water Department

DNR Water inspection. We are within compliance
Installed new Missions system for wells

Repairs made to Well #2 chlorination system
Met with Viking tower maintenance to discuss maintenance program
Lead & Copper water samples collected for DNR
Hoffman Hills walk through inspection

Leak repair Villa Park #1

Leak repair Villa Park # 2

Leak repair Villa Park #3

Leak repair Pershing

Pressure test high school’s new water main

Sewer Department
DNR inspection we are within compliance
Canterbury clogged sewer mains cleared, bypass reported

Regional 1&I relief needed due to wet weather event Battlefield Septic was called
in to assist in avoiding bypass

Fog inspections conducted with local business’s (Fats, 0il, Grease)



(Sewer Continued)

Hoffman Hills walk through inspection

Repairs made to 94 liftstation control probe
Repairs made to Wimpy’s float controls and pump
Repairs made to D liftstation control board

Clean up Canterbury bypass and surrounding area

Streets Department

Tree removal’s 103 & EE, Ross & Quarry RD
Sign repairs 103, New Melville, Hoffman Hills

Dirt Work, Water repair clean up Hawthorne, Sarah Court, Southview, Lone
Oak, Villa Park

Sink Hole repair Knight St
Pothole repair’s 103,94, Jackson, Arrowhead, Quarry Rd
Cleared blocked culverts Covington& New Melville



Manthly Water Loss 2024

Manth
Amount of Gallons Pumped
Dollar Amount Sold
Gallons of Water Sold
Flushing
Leaks/Adjustments
City Usage {notl bllled)
Fire Dept
Tower Overflows
Residuals

Total Gallons Accounted For
% Water Loss
Amount of Water Lost

Willard North #1

Wiltard South #2

Meadows West #1

Meadows East #2

Correction per MRWA Willard Well 1&
Total Water Pumped

Customer Count
City Commercial Irrigation
City Commercial 1 SPF
City Commercial 3 Waler only
City Resldential Irrigatlon
Clly Residential 1 SPF
City Residential 3 Water Only
Rural Irrigation
Rural Residential 1 SPF
Rural Residential 2 Lagoon
Rural Residentia' 3 Water Only
Rura! Commercial 2 Lagoon
Rural Commerclal 3 Water only
2ero-Non Bllted

Current Month

Number of Total Customers

Service Cansumption
City Commercial Irrigation
City Commerclal 1 SPF
City Commaercial 3 Water only
City Residential Irrigation
Cizy Restdential 1 SPF
City Residentlal 3 Water Only
Rural Irrigation
Rural Residential 1 SPF
Rural Residential 2 Lagaon
Rural Resident:al 3 Watar Qnly
Rural Commercial 2 Lagoon
Rural Commercial 3 Water only
Zero-Non Billed
Total Gallons of Consumption

5
January February March April May Annual Average Annuyal
22,132,300 25,487,800 22,794,600 23,592,100 25,331,000 23,867,560 115,337,800
$81,280.17 $85,823.98 $79,830.51 582,73B.98 $99,169.12 $85,768.55 $428,842.76
14,708,000 16,491,009 14,190,044 15,238,017 18,627,025 15,850,819 79,254,095
45,000 45,000 200,000 200,000 500,000 198,000 990,000
950,000 850,000 130,000 130,000 1,400,000 652,000 3,460,000
13,000 30,030 44,000 28,000 19,000 26,800 134,000
57,000 58,000 70,000 57,000 57,000 60,000 300,000
0 0 0 0 0 [ 0
160,000 160,000 160,000 160,000 160,000 160,000 800,000
15,863,000 17,546,009 14,680,044 15,728,017 20,687,025 16,9C0,819 84,504,095
28.33% 31.16% 35.60% 33.33% 18.33% 29.19%
6,269,300 7,841,791 8,114,556 7,864,083 4,643,575 6,966,741 34,833,705
1,346,700 2,079,500 1.604,800 963,700 1,999,8C0 1,598,900 7,994,500
1,718,400 2,143,000 2,119,300 2,570,200 2,233,800 2,157,060 10,785,300
10,774,200 11,048.300 11,687,900 11,155,200 11,867.400 11,307,400 56,537,000
8,293,000 10,217,000 7,382,000 8,899,000 9,230,000 g.804,200 44,021,000
o 0 0 ] [V] a [
22,132,300 25,487,800 22,794,600 23,592,100 25,331,000 23,867,560 119,337,800
18 18 18 18 18 18
141 138 138 140 139 i39
19 20 21 22 21 1 178
2 2 2 3 3 2
2114 2114 2128 2145 2136 2,127
72 72 71 72 72 72 2,202
3 3 q 4 5 4
2! 2 2 2 2 2
274 274 274 273 276 274
891 890 892 888 839 890 1,170
3 3 3 3 3 3
14 14 14 14 14 14
3] 8 9 9 10 9 26
3561 3558 3576 35583 3588 3575 3575
19,000 4,000 75,000 268,000 258,000 124,800
1,261,000 1,545,000 1,421,000 1,708,000 2,269,601 1,640,800
68,000 74,000 171,000 216,000 257,000 157,200 1,922,800
1,000 . 1,000 - 2,000 800
7,711,000 8,755,007 7.267,039 7,559,01C 8,987,010 8,055,813
314,000 321,000 281,000 298,000 392,000 321,200 8,377,813
- . E 1,000 1,000 400
12,000 13,000 10,000 10,000 12,000 11,400
931,000 1,040,000 894,000 968,000 1,021,000 970,800
4,258,000 4,601,002 3,905,005 4,064,007 4,725,014 4,310,606 5,293,206
54,000 29,000 30,000 40,000 40,000 38,600
58,000 71.000 62,000 61,000 62,000 62,800 101,400
21,000 38,000 73,000 45,000 601,000 155,600 155,600
14,708,000 16,491,009 14,190,044 15,238,017 18,627,025 15,850,819 15,850,819



el CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Consent Agenda Item #5d

Board Attendance Report

#
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda




1no

'

(¥2/2/¥) NOSTIM 104D

Y¥3LSVYONY1 IDA0T

>| >| >

>

> >| >

> > >

> > >

Y3178 A3ISVD

TIVH NOANV1

| > >| >

1no

HSOLVMS 1100S

1no

[V} A

3INI3N AIAva

> >| >| >

> >| >| >

> >| >| >

> > >| >

A

> >| >| >| >| >

A

(W31 OYd YOAVIN) HLIWS AOYL

veoz/ve/9

A

1no

A

Qyivd VS HOAVIN

vzoz/ot/9

veoz/ec/s

vzoz/et/s

veoe/ee/y

vzoz/e/y

vzoz/se/e

vZoe/re/e

JAIVN

NOISS3S TVID3dS

NOISS3S 1vI03dS

A

A

YILSYINYT 3DA00

A

A

H3ITE AISYO

ino

1no

1no

TIVH NOANV1

>| > >=| >| >

1no

HSOLVYMS 1100S

1no

INIDI AIAVA

1no

1no

A

{IN3L OYd YOAVIN) HLINS AOHL

1no

A

(3Lv1) A

A

>| > >| >

>| >| >| >

vT0z/vT/e

vzoz/1t/e

vzoc/9/e

veoe/v/e

vzoz/9z/tT

veoe/it/e

> > >| >| >| >| >

QYivd VS YOAVIA

vzoz/ae/t

veoz/8/n

JNVYN

NOISS3S 1V103dS

NOISS3S TvId3dS

NOISS3S 1vI23dS

A:Q3aN3aLlY

JHOd3Y IINVANILLY QHvO4d 77202




el CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O. Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda ltem #11

Appointments to the Planning & Zoning Board

a. Marianne Hill
b. Sam Baird

#
0708/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda




APPLICATION FOR APPOINTMENT TO BOARD

NAME: (Please Print) Mamm\mﬂ H‘l\H DATE OF APPLICATION: (( -20- Z,'—f

aooress: |27 N Stade H‘LOU\ Z Willard Mo 57s]
PHONE NUMBER: LH'? T [~-43&

Do you live within the city limits of Willard? [)(] YES [ IJNO

If YES, how long have you been a resident of Willard? L"p MGO&VS

Please choose the areas of most interest:

[)(] Planning & Zoning [ ] Park Advisory Board [ ] Economic Development Task Force
[ ]Tree Board [ ]Board of Adjustments

Have you served in this capacity before? [ 1YES [\J NO

If YES, please explain:

Please describe why you would like to serve:

T beliege o Abe wdw\u oL CAxie eno\aww& « Wond a&ﬁc&s

: it el 4
A;P WO i W\'Lmb%s
s® destribe any education or expekignce that would assist you in serving:

| certify that the above information is correct. | understand that appointments are recommended by the
Mayor to the Board of Aldermen for approval and that | may be asked to provide additional information.

Signature:( /&/M Date: /ﬂ P 'O/Lfg/

Thank you for your interest and desire to serve your community!
Return this completed application to the City Clerk by mail at: PO Box 187, Willard, MO 65781
By fax at: (417) 742-3080 or drop off at Willard City Hall, 224 W. Jackson St.




APPLICATION FOR APPOINTMENT TO BOARD
I

7 . .
NAME: (Please Print) SAM (g@-v&o DATE OF APPLICATION: A 27-2Y4

aooress: &1 8 Ml S

PHONE NUMBER: _ 7 [ 7 _gy4-0626

Do you live within the city limits of Willard? A ves [ ]NO

If YES, how long have you been a resident of Willard? /1D VRS

Please choose the areas of most interest:

Wlanning & Zoning [ 1Park Advisory Board [ 1 Economic Development Task Force
[ 1Tree Board [ ] Board of Adjustments
Have you served in this capacity before? [MYES [ INO

If YES, please explain: '
AS ADEORMans b pigvon  ppeox S 248
1

Please describe why you would like to serve:

é/’/)um_( Rr)fg@f 15 O 70 pale Alonin/)

Please describe any education or experience that would assist you in serving:

2.2 s 0 Pote Serscs, ¥ s MAOA

| certify that the above information is correct. | understand that appointments are recommended by the

Mayor to the Board of Aldermen for approval and that | may be asked to provide additional information.
Signature: _, - Date: 6-27-29

7

Thank you for your interest and desire to serve your community!
Return this completed application to the City Clerk by mail at: PO Box 187, Wiilard, MO 65781
By fax at: (417) 742-3080 or drop off at Willard City Hall, 224 W. Jackson St




e CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Item #12

Ordinance Adopting the Tyler Technologies App
as a Payment Option for Utility Bills

#
0708/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



T @3ed TVILNIAIINOD 8YS918N-0TL6L1-120C

0$ 0s$ aoepalu| ss322y AN JAD AW
aung A A

- . U d8]il

.mucmcmyo_m_\,_ |e101 8suadI] uondLivsag
_m::c< m._m>>tom._w_>._.

V€56-18459 OIN PJE|IIM

ddy ajiqo ssa2ay Alian aweN ajonDd uosyoef M vze
ve/it/a uonesdx3 alonp paejiim jo AuD
SELEIERDG]p) Ag pa1onD 1104 uonelonp sajes

L8 ®

I9JAY “<.

&




¢ 9ded TVILNIAIINGD 8Y91BIN-0CL6L7-1720C

0s |e10] Pesjuo)

0s 0$ {er0] Alewwing
S921AIBS J3JAL B30

alemyos JajA] |e30)

5394 3ulainday §334 9w} duQ Alewwng



€ 93ed TVILNIAIANOD 8Y9I8IN-0CL6LY-1720C

‘JusWwasiby 3yl yum 90URPIOIDE Ul PBDIOAUI 2Q ||IM 5321A19S 950U 'SaDIAIRS Juswabeuew abueyd Aue paseysind sey juaid 4|

‘Buiuue(d 1dafoud jo uopneniul buimo|ioy Aleipawil Yuow ay3 jo Aep 3sii ay3 uo buiuuibaq

's1ealle ut Ajyjuow pasjoaul aq ‘Aue ) 'sadines Juswsbeuey 198(0id paredipaq uswindop buiuue|d uoneluswalduw sy 4o Asaiep uodn padioAu) ag |jeys juawied ‘papiroid
ale sadIAIRS Buluuelqd 198014, 81aym ‘10NOP JO SDUEPIOAR BY] 104 BJIABS BY) JO AuaAiep 218|dwod uodn padioAu| e sediaas 3d1d paxy J1aylo ‘papiaoid asimiayio se 1dsax]

"SISEQ S|BLISJRW PUR BWII1 B UO PaJBAISP $22IAI3S [EN1DR 3y} 1UBI|D B2I0AU! ||Im JBJAL ‘pPalew|Ise se pajonb aie SUOISIBAUOD BIBYM 'UoiIdO UOISISAUOD AQ 'JUBWUOIIAUS UOIIINPOIH/EAI
Ol B1EP PAUSAUO) BY] peO| O] 8dueldadde Jusi)) uodn 905 pue ‘uoido uoisIaALOD AQ ‘e1ep PSLIBAUOD By} JO AUBAIDP [eIHUl UOdN 905 PadIOAU| BJ8 SUOISIDAUOD 83)-Paxid

‘9|npow Aq ‘seanpado.d

dopjsep woisnd jo Asaljep uodn 9,06 pue ‘3|npow Ag 'sUoiEpUBWILLIOIaY d311deld 153g 2yl Jo Aiaaiap uodn %05 padloAu] 39 |jeys sad1Aas Bu|nsuo?) ssad0.1d Ssauisng aoy-paxi4
"PRIBAIIRP Se PIDI0AUI BG ||BYS $88) SB3IAIS [euOIssajold 1aylo pue ucnejuawa|dul]

*Mmojaq pajedipul se padjioaul 3q [jeys uonejonb sajes siy3 ul papnjdul sadIAI3S 10} SII4

‘Juawaalby ay1 yum pIodde Ul Jayeslayl A|lenuue padioAul S|EmMaual ylim ‘1usweaibe
ay3 Jepun wusy a|qedijdde ay1 yim ubije o3 patesoad ale sa8) yons Aue pue ‘(uondudsqns pue ‘bunsoy ‘sees oy) paubis sem uonelonb siyi a1ep ayl buimoyos yluow ayy 4o Aep 11
8Y1 UO JO (BdUBUBIUIRA 10)) JUSID BY) O} B|qISSIIIL BIeMYOS By3 sxew 13jAL uaym ajqehed 3si1y ale s99) uoinduIsqns pue ‘saay BuilsoH 'sesy sees ‘saay oddng pue adueusluiely [enuuy e
‘alempley a3 Jo AI9AIPP Uodn PadIoAUl B1e 9JURUBIUIRW DIEMPIEY JO BUO Jedh J0) sBaq
‘A1anl[Sp uodn padIoAuUl 8ie BleMpIeY JO) S33{ e
'8|Q1SS822€ 3|qR|IBAR B1RM1OS YDNs saxewl Uajh) usym (1) Jo A3 a5uai| ay) Jo AiaAlap (1) Jo J2Ij4es sy} uodn PadIoAU] a1k diemyos Aued-pliyl pue Js|A) 10} S39) B5UBdIT e
papnjaul si uonejonb sajes SIY3 YIIym Ul JUILINDOP Jejius 10 ‘Judwpudawe ‘Juawadsbe ue
ut sway Juawied o} 123(gns ‘swuay Huimoljoy 3yl 01 wIoyu0d [eys ‘ulalay suondwnsse paysy Aue o3 139(qns 3nq a|qedijdde se ‘sway pies 10y JuswAed ‘Ajjeuonippy “swiay s)1 03 3[gns
pue saiued ay) usamyaq ( Juswaalby,) Juswaaibe Gunsixa ayy o3 pappe Aqaiay ‘awes jo jeaosdde Jo ainjeubis s,juai|) uodn ‘aie uonelonb sajes siyy ul swal Jeys sasibe Juaip)

"Pa1e21pUIl 9SIMIBUIO0 SS9|UN JedA BUC JO WIS) B PaJIapISUDI S| Sees

A>1|0d [3AeJ} ssauISNg plepue)s § 4|4 0} Pulpiodde PaLINdul Se PAJIOAU] BB SIDIAISS B}ISUO Y1IM PaleIDOSSe sasuadx]

Juswalbe siy) ul PIjouU BSIMIBYIO SSBJUN A[SI0WRL PRISAIIRP 3q ||IM FJOA

SIUBWIWOY)



¥ 93ed TVILN3AIINOD 8Y918N-02/6/17-1Z0C

WO ‘BWeN uld

:91eqg ‘leaciddy Jawolsn)

191e| S| JSABYIIYM ‘1DBIIU0D) BY] JO 31 SAIIIBT By} JO 91ep 310N By} WO} SYIUOW () XIS JO4
p|ay aq [|1m swa1l [euondo Joy Bupud ‘01913y3 JUBWIPUSWE JO 1DBIIUOD By} Ul PIleIIpUl ISIMISYIO0 5S3JUN

EESIIVES
—SEes-19[\/SUI9]/ W00 (DA LD[AT MMMW//.SCTTY 12494 PUNO} SWIS) $321ASS Sees 519141 01 193(qns aie suoin|os 1ajA| paysoy-1ual|d Buiureiuod juswaalfe ue 0} pappe sUoIN|os palsoy Jo sees Auy

“JUBWIUOIIAUS P33SOYy
ay1 40 Aljige|ieae uodn pPadIOAUL BQ ||IM §834 SEES [enuuy 31Ins 1npoud 1s1y 341 Jo 3AI-06 ay1 uodn sacqe paisi| saa4 Juawabeuepy 18l0id Aue 10y JUBID 8210AUI ||IM JBIAL B3NS

pnpoud s|qedijdde ay3 jo anij-ob ay3 uodn pay|ig aq [im ‘way aull Aq ‘%S Bululewss ay| "9|npayas uopesBiw a3ins Pnpoid sy} Jo jeaosdde Ju1D uodn aaoqe Pa1sl| 5934 SSIIAISS
uonelbin Aue o 9%0G Ju31|D 3210AU| ||Im JB[A] suonesBiw Joy Ajjeayinads seay o1 Aldde |jeys suua) JuswAed Huimo|joy ay} 'aaoge paiels Aieiuod ayl 03 buiyihue Buipuelsylimion



el CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Item #13

Annual State Statutory Code Updates

and Supplementation Process

#
0708/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda




City of Willard, Missouri 2023 Statutory Updates

City of Willard
2023 Statutory Updates Incorporated During Supplement # 39

The Sections of the Code noted in the table below have been updated with the 2023 statutory material.
The City’s attorney may want to review these changes to confirm these revisions are necessary. All
revised Sections will be in effect following the City’s adoption of the Code.

Section/Subsection | Description of the Revision Pursuant to
of the Code RSMo. Section
120.020 A new Subsection (A)(15) regarding certain law enforcement | 610.021

and/or public safety agency information was added and
subsequent Subsections were renumbered. In former Subsection
(AX(15) [now (A)(16)], we deleted “which is or appears to be
terrorist in nature and.”

210.840 Additional provisions were added to Subsection (G) of this | 571.030
Section setting out an exception to certain weapons regulations
for certain school officers and school protection officers.

210.1230 Subsection (A) of this Section was revised to read in part, “...or | 407.302
utility regulated under Chapter 386 or 393, RSMo., including
twisted pair copper telecommunications wiring of pair or greater
existing in 19. 22. 24, or 26 gauge burnt wire, bleachers,
guardrails...”

210.1880 We added this Section regarding “drug masking products.” 579.041

1of'1



2024 ADOPTING ORDINANCE

BILL NO. ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING AND ENACTING A NEW CODE OF ORDINANCES OF THE CITY OF
WILLARD; ESTABLISHING THE SAME; PROVIDING FOR THE REPEAL OF CERTAIN
ORDINANCES NOT INCLUDED THEREIN, EXCEPT AS HEREIN EXPRESSLY PROVIDED;
PROVIDING FOR THE MANNER OF AMENDING SUCH CODE OF ORDINANCES; PROVIDING
PENALTY FOR THE VIOLATION THEREOF; AND PROVIDING WHEN THIS ORDINANCE SHALL
BECOME EFFECTIVE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE CITY OF WILLARD AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. That pursuant to Section 71.943 of the Revised Statutes of Missouri, the codification of ordinances,
as set out in Titles I through VII, each inclusive, of the "Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard" is hereby
adopted and enacted as the "Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard"; which shall supersede all other
general and permanent ordinances of the City passed on or before April 8, 2024, to the extent provided in
Section 3 hereof.

Section 2. That all provisions of such Code shall be in full force and effect from and after the effective date
of this ordinance as set forth herein.

Section 3. That all ordinances of a general and permanent nature of the City adopted on final passage on or
before April 8, 2024, and not included in such Code or recognized and continued in force by reference therein,
are hereby repealed from and after the effective date of this ordinance, except those which may be specifically
excepted by separate ordinance, and except the following which are hereby continued in full force and effect,
unless specifically repealed by separate ordinance:

a.  Ordinances promising or guaranteeing the payment of money for the City, or authorizing the
issuance of any bonds or notes of the City or any other evidence of the City's indebtedness, or
authorizing any contract or obligation assumed by the City;

b.  Ordinances levying taxes or making special assessments;

c.  Ordinances appropriating funds or establishing salaries and compensation, and providing for
expenses;

d.  Ordinances granting franchises or rights to any person, firm or corporation;

e.  Ordinances relating to the dedication, opening, closing, naming, establishment of grades,
improvement, altering, paving, widening or vacating of streets, alleys, sidewalks or public places;

f. Ordinances authorizing or relating to particular public improvements;

g.  Ordinances respecting the conveyances or acceptance of real property or easements in real
property;



n.

0.

ADOPTING ORDINANCE

Ordinances dedicating, accepting or vacating any plat or subdivision in the City or any part
thereof, or providing regulations for the same;

Ordinances annexing property to the City;

All zoning and subdivision ordinances not specifically repealed and not included herein;
Ordinances establishing TIF districts or redevelopment districts;

Ordinances relating to traffic schedules (i.e. stop signs, parking limits, etc.);

All ordinances relating to personnel regulations (i.e. pensions, retirement, job descriptions and
insurance, etc.);

Ordinances authorizing the establishment of industrial development corporations;

Ordinances establishing tax rates for the City.

That the repeal provided for in this Section shall not be construed to revive any ordinance or part thereof that
has been repealed by a subsequent ordinance which is repealed by this ordinance.

That the repeal provided for in this Section shall not affect any offense or act committed or done or any penalty
or forfeiture incurred or any contract or right established or accruing before the effective date of this ordinance,
nor shall it affect any prosecution, suit or proceeding pending or any judgment rendered prior to such date.

Section 4. That any and all additions and amendments to such Code when passed in such form as to indicate
the intention of the Board of Aldermen to make the same a part thereof shall be deemed to be incorporated in
such Code so that reference to the "Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard" shall be understood and
intended to include such additions and amendments.

Section 5.

Whenever in this Code or any other ordinance of the City of Willard any act is prohibited or is
made or declared to be unlawful or an offense or a misdemeanor, or in the doing of any act as
required or the failure to do any act is declared to be unlawful or an offense or a misdemeanor,
where no specific penalty is provided therefore, the violation of any such provision of this Code
or other ordinance of the City of Willard shall be punished by a fine of not more than five hundred
dollars ($500.00) or by imprisonment in jail for a period not exceeding ninety (90) days, or by
both such fine and imprisonment.

Whenever any provision of the Revised Statutes of Missouri or other Statute of the State limits
the authority of the City to punish the violation of any particular provision of these ordinances or
rules, regulations or orders promulgated pursuant thereto to a fine of less amount than that
provided in this Section or imprisonment for a shorter term than that provided in this Section, the
violation of such particular provision of these ordinances or rules, regulations or orders shall be
punished by the imposition of not more than the maximum fine or imprisonment so authorized,
or by both such fine and imprisonment.

Whenever any provision of the Revised Statutes of Missouri or other Statute of the State
establishes a penalty differing from that provided by this Section for an offense similar to any
offense established by these ordinances, rules, regulations or other orders of the City, the violation



ADOPTING ORDINANCE

of such City law, ordinance, rule, regulation or order shall be punished by the fine or
imprisonment established for such similar offense by such State law.

d.  Every day any violation of this Code or any other ordinance of this City of Willard shall continue
shall constitute a separate offense.

e.  Whenever any act is prohibited by this Code, by an amendment thereof, or by any rule or
regulation adopted thereunder, such prohibition shall extend to and include the causing, securing,
aiding or abetting of another person to do said act. Whenever any act is prohibited by this Code,
an attempt to do the act is likewise prohibited.

Section 6. That in case of the amendment by the Board of Aldermen of any Section of such Code for which
a penalty is not provided, the general penalty as provided in Section 5 of this ordinance shall apply to the
Section as amended; or in case such amendment contains provisions for which a penalty other than the
aforementioned general penalty is provided in another Section in the same Chapter, the penalty so provided
in such other Section shall be held to relate to the Section so amended, unless such penalty is specifically
repealed therein.

Section 7. That a copy of such Code shall be kept on file in the office of the City Clerk, preserved in looseleaf
form or in such other form as the City Clerk may consider most expedient. It shall be the express duty of the
City Clerk, or someone authorized by said officer, to insert in their designated places all amendments and all
ordinances or resolutions which indicate the intention of the Board of Aldermen to make the same part of such
Code when the same have been printed or reprinted in page form and to extract from such Code all provisions
which from time to time may be repealed by the Board of Aldermen. This copy of such Code shall be available
for all persons desiring to examine the same.

Section 8. That it shall be unlawful for any person to change or alter by additions or deletions any part or
portion of such Code, or to insert or delete pages or portions thereof, or to alter or tamper with such Code in
any manner whatsoever which will cause the law of the City of Willard to be misrepresented thereby. Any
person violating this Section shall be punished as provided in Section 5 of this ordinance.

Section 9. It is hereby declared to be the intention of the Board of Aldermen that the Sections, paragraphs,
sentences, clauses and phrases of this ordinance and the Code hereby adopted are severable, and if any phrase,
clause, sentence, paragraph or Section of this ordinance or the Code hereby adopted shall be declared
unconstitutional or otherwise invalid by the valid judgment or decree of a court of competent jurisdiction,
such unconstitutionality or invalidity shall not affect any of the remaining phrases, clauses, sentences,
paragraphs and Sections of this ordinance or the Code hereby adopted.

Section 10. This ordinance and the Code adopted hereby shall become effective ,2024.

PASSED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE CITY OF WILLARD THIS DAY OF
2024.



ADOPTING ORDINANCE

APPROVED BY THE MAYOR OF THE CITY OF WILLARD THIS DAY OF
2024.

Mayor

ATTEST:

City Clerk
Approved as to form: , City Attorney

READ TWO TIMES AND PASSED AT A MEETING OF THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE CITY
OF WILLARD, MISSOURI ON THE DAY OF 2024.

MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN:

Board Member Votes
Yes No Abstained

2 READ
MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN:

Board Member Votes
Yes No Abstained



el CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Item #14

Consider Proposal to Eliminate the Mayor’s Stipend and
Create an Annual Parks Department Line Item to Support
Youth Program Participation and Access

#
0708/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda




First Reading: 02-10-14 Second Reading: 02-10-14

BILL NO. 14-02 ORDINANCE: 140210
AN ORDINANCE
FIXING. the compensation of all officers and employees of the City of Willard for the 2014 Fiscal
Year.

WHEREAS, Section 115.060 of the code of the City of Willard requires the Board of Aldermen to fix the
compensation of all officers and employees, and

WHEREAS, The Board of Aldermen recognize that employees periodically terminate service and new
employees are hired to fill their positions which, depending on their qualifications, may
dictate that either a lower, or higher, level of compensation would be appropriate for the new

employee, and

WEIEREAS, The Board of Aldermen recognize that organizational changes may dictate leaving existing
positions vacant or establishment of a new job description to efficiently and cost effectively

provide the services to the community.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF THE CITY OF
WILLARD, MISSOURI AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1: The Board of Aldermen do hereby fix the compensation of all officers and employees for
Fiscal Year 2014 as set forth in the attached Schedule A, which is incorporated herein by reference as if

set forth in full.

Section 2: Severability Clause. If any Section, subdivision, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance
is for any reason held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of
this ordinance. The Board of Aldermen hereby declares that it would have adopted the ordinance and
each Section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more
Sections, subsections, sentences, clauses, or phases be declared invalid.

Section 3: This Ordiriance shall be in full force and effect from and after the date of its passage by the
Board of Aldermén and approval of the Mayor.

oot ming. LA A LDEN SOILH,

Approved as to form: 9/5/—%5

dity Attomey ~ ~

ATTESTED BY: APPROVED BY:

O- W & /é'{/ ;%’4’/,(@'4

DALE DUVALL, CITY CLERK WENDELL FORSHEE, MAYOR




BILL NO. 14-02 ORDINANCE: 140210

READ TWO TIMES AND PASSED at the meeting of the Board of Aldermen of the City of Willard,
. Missouri, on the 10% day of February 2014.

MEMBERS OF THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN: YES NO ABSTAINED

il - "
DAV]D’ROGGE _EES
Ly v

DAVn’) HEMPHILL
Cpecte QM?/M/ ~

ﬂ@cosmf j:ﬂ /
o

KEVIN MCDONALD

Bmywwiur(—j

BRYAN VINCENT




ZJo 1 98ed

00"9T$ - 08°2T$
00°9T$ - 08°CTS
00'9T$ - 08°CTS
00°LTS$ - 00°E€TS
00°6T$ - 00°VTS
00°22$ - 00°STS
v/N
00'STS - 00°0T$
00°LTS$ - 00°TTS
00°L1$-00°TTS
00°LTS - 00°'TTS
00°LTS - 00°'TTS
00°ZT$-00°TTS

000°8€S$ - 002'TES
000‘8ES - 00Z'TES

V/N
00°LTS$-00°CTS
00°LTS - 00°TTS
00°STS - 00°0TS
00°STS - 00°0T$

v/N

v/N
v/N
gahojdwa jou — papenuody  v/N
awn jjny-auedepn  v/N
v/N
aalojdwa jou —~ payuioddy  v/N
aafojdws jou — pajuioddy  v/N
aafo|dwa jou —pajujoddy  ¥/N

#Y/N 7

JONVY -

NOILVYSNAdINOD

Y 31INA3HIS

.\.\m%QGQ

Jnoy Jad SEVT S
noyted  E€EVT  §
dnoyatad  €EVT  $
anoy Jad 0L9T S
ioyJtad 98T S
Jnoy Jad 79°0C S
JesAsad  91°8€9TSS
1noy 1ad ({14 $
Jnoysed  00'TT S
Anoy tad 00°ET S
noysed  TSET  $
Jnoysed  TS'ST S
Jnoy tad €91 S
JeaA 1od 29'9L'9ES
Jeshiad  Z8'p9L'9ES
Jeah tod 0S'ZE0VY S
Anoy Jad G/l €T S
Jnoy 1ad 29'2T S
Jnoy Jad 9¢°¢T S
Jnoy Jad 9€'2T S
aeah Jod G9°05E'1SS
JeaA Jad 08'SSS‘ElS
Jeah Jod 00'0TT8ES
JeaA sad 9 VETTSS
Jeah Jad Y6186 LYS
Jead sad 00°000'09S
anoy J1ad 000tT S
Jnoy Jod 00°0FT S
anoysad  00OVT $
yuow sad 0000 S
NOILYSNIdINOD
7102

122130 331j0d
4292140 ®d1jod

492140 3dljod

ueuwijoaied 1o1uas

Jedodio)

anpalaaiueadiag

ljod jo 21O

JMNJOAN SPUNOID 1§ DIUBUIIUIBIA|
JIOAN D3ueUdIUIEIA AN
JdIo/\ 2aueuajuley AN
JaIon Paueuazuten Ajmn
Jaxylopn daueudzuie|nl AN
Jo)Io\ 2aueuajuielAl ANjnnN
Josiazadng aiueuaguieln|
losiatadng adueuajuielnl

SO d1jnd §0 103232g

49D Idueuld

}ap uno) Aindag/isiuondadroy
uepiuyoa ] Jazen/3ulliig Auin
uepluyoa | Jarem/3uljig Aunn
uawdojanaq 13 Suiuue|d Jo lopallq
3210 Ao

J30140 @dueuly

iuejjnsuo)

192140 |efdueuld Jai1yd
Jojensiuiwpy A

a8pnf jeddiuniyl

Asuiony Sunnaasold

Aswiony A

J0Aen

NOILLdI¥IS3a 01

F1NA3IHIS NOILYSNAdINOD ¥102



¢ Jogs8ed

"PaJ13 s} uonisod 3y} UsYM sjseq ased Ag 9sed B Uo udwiIap|y Jo pieog ayi Ag paysijgelsa aq jjeys ,v/N, Pologe)saSuel uoesusdwiod ||V 4.

00°SLS - 00°0FS
00°05$ - 00°0€S
00°ZT$ -~ 0S°CTS

00°ST$ - SE'£9

00'TS - 00°TIS
00°VTS - 00°0TS
000'st$ - DOD’SES
3W3-|Jn} - 3UEdEA 000°SE$- 005°£28
00’STS ~ 00°ETS
000'2€$ - 000°5TS
0D'€TS - 0S0TS
05°9TS - 00°VTS
00°FT$-00°2TS
000'82$ - D00‘TTS
000°0€$ - 000°VZS
000°0€S - 000°VTS

v/N
v/N
LY'€1-85°0TS
000823 - 000°TTS
v/N
00S'9ES - 002'TES
V/N
00'0Z$ - 00°STS
00°STS - 00°0TS
00'9T$ - 08°ZTS
00°9TS - 08°2TS

Anoy Jad
anoy Jad

Jnoy Jad

Jnoy Jad

Jrioy Jad
Jnoy Jad
JedA tad
Jeah Jad
inoy Jad
Jeah iad
Jnoy aad
Jnoy Jad
Jnoy Jad
Jesh Jad
Aeah aad
Jeah Jad

Jnoy Jad
Jnoy Jad
Jnoy Jad
Aezh Jad
Jead Jad
Jeal rad
Jeal Jad
Jnoy Jad
Jnoy Jad
Jnoy Jad
Jnoy sad

8SPvT

W U D U U U U U U U D U V> U V)

OEPT  §
6TPT  $
(1] 28 4 R~
00°0S.'5Z$
00°096°Z€S
00°000°SES
00"0YT’6ES
LS8BT S
8SPT S
S6'ET S
EEYT $

uepiuysa) 1|
uepluydal sio
103931417 Juswadeuey Aduadiauwig
|EUOSEDS PUE 3Wii-1iEd [EUOEDIDIY
3 o13enby ‘wesSold ‘suods
343D Buiseyding
(52801330 aniEs3Y) 1921430 d3ljod
Jofe @djjod
Joadsuj sapo) Suipjing
uepIuyda| Juswidopaag g Sujuue|d
18221130 suonje[py Aunwiwo)
210 Ao Aindag
Joiesado Juawdinky
230/ BdUBUUIEIA
)sijenads uoiealday
JO3EUIPJOO) WEIB0ld
Jojeuipioo) syods
pajiid/uoiisod aw-1ied

SUDNISOd [eUOSES /AW 1-HEd /1uEedEeA

Josiaiadng adueudjuleI
uidesspuet/soueuajuiepy
J|saqg uo.i/3s1|e1ads uoijealay
151[eads uoiealdaYy
J0lBUIp.00) suojielado
Josjniadns soizenby g suods
$321A49S AJIUNWIwIo) Jo Jo3aadig
343} N0 [eddIUnA

JUBISISSY SAIIBJISILILUPY
422110 921j0d

1321340 321j0d



s CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Item #15

Public Works Well #1: Public Works would like the Board
to consider 2 quotes to replace the aging and

undersized transformer.

g
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



Date: 6/26/24

Company: City of Willard
Contact: Trevor

From: Andrew Dishon

Project Name: Well #1 Service
Proposal Number: 006

Inclusions: Labor and material for the following

>
>

>
>
>

v

VVVY

New feeder wire from existing 480v meter to MTS for upgrade to 200-amp service

50KVA transformer to be mounted outside to re-feed existing 240/120v panelboard inside
well house

All wiring from MTS to disconnect and disconnect to transformer

New 100-amp main breaker at 240/120v panel inside well house

Tie-in of existing panel located at sump pump (junction box to be provided to re-route feeder
circuit to inside of well house)

All existing 120v circuits at 240/120-meter combo to be relocated to panel inside well house
for demo of meter

New circuit added inside well house for future AC unit

Demo of old transformer and disconnects inside well house

Terminations and testing

Normal business hours

Exclusions:

YVVVY

Overtime

Utility fees

Concrete pad for transformer
Taxes

Anything not mentioned above

This pricing is valid for thirty days.
Base price: $9,495.00

Acceptance Signature:

Date:




119 West Center ST
P.O. Box 475
Rogersvilie MO 65742
me |

-—— N - - - - Richard Magruder
C

== -_—
Stephen G. Magruder

e ==
ELECTR C A L, I N

INDUSTRIAL POWER AND AUTOMATION & COMMERCIAL X _ N "
ELECTRICAL CONTRACTING LICENSED AND INSURED Phone 417-753-3333 Fax 417-753-3398

PRICE QUOTATION

Date: 6/26/2024

Company: City of Willard
Contact: Public Works
From: Todd Wichmann
Ref: Well #1 service
Project Quote #:1.S-024-129

Quotes Includes:

Labor and materials for the following:

New wiring from existing 480v meter to manual transfer switch to accommodate 200-amp service

Wiring from transfer switch to new disconnect for transformer feed

Installation of new outdoor 45KV A transformer

Tie-ins for secondary side of transformer to existing 240/120 panel located in well house

Existing 240/120 panel shall be upsized to 100 amp to accommodate secondary panel feeder out to other building
where sump pump is located (Conduit will be intercepted and junction box will be added for splicing)

All circuits from low voltage pole will be relocated to existing 100-amp panel in well house for removal of pole
(Confirmation on this from Liberty Utilities)

New receptacle for AC unit located in well house

Taxes

Normal business hours

A\ VVVYYVY

VVYV

FOR THE SUM OF: $9,903.00
Due to materials cost, proposal must be reviewed after 30 days

Excludes:
» Removal of power pole
> Overtime

» Anything not mentioned above

NET DUE UPON RECEIPT OF INVOICE

All material is guaranteed to be as specified. All work to be completed in a workman-like manner according to standard practices.
Any alteration or deviation from the above specifications involving extra cost will be executed only upon written orders, and will
become an extra charge over and above the estimate. All agreements contingent upon necessary insurance. Our workers are
fully covered by Workman’s Compensation Insurance.

Authorized Signature:

Acceptance of Price Quote:

Date of Acceptance:




e CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O. Box 187  Willard, MO 65781  417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Item #16

Public Works Building: Public Works would like the Board
to consider 2 quotes for wiring and data cable installation in
the newly constructed side of the public works building.

——— . — — — —  — —— —.——————————————
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



Date: 6/27/24

Company: City of Willard

Contact: Trevor Hoffman

From: Andrew Dishon

Project Name: Public works new offices
Proposal number: 007

Inclusions: Labor and material for the following

Power:
»  (15) quadplex receptacles throughout office area
» (1) outdoor GFl located near outdoor AC unit
» (2) duplex bathroom GFl’s
» (1) dedicated fridge receptacle
» (1) 220v plug for heat/ac unit
» (1) 220v circuit for outdoor ac unit (with local disconnect)
> (2) dedicated quadplex receptacles at breakroom counter (GFl protected)
Lighting:
» (45) 6” surface mount LED lights
»  (2) outdoor wall packs
> (2) exit emergency lights with remote heads
» (1) exit emergency light
»  (3) emergency lights
Data:
> (8) data rough ins with cabling to switch location
» New ethernet cable ran from existing network area to new switch location
Service:
» New 100-amp breaker at existing panel to feed new office sub panel
» Feeder for sub panel to be ran in conduit using aluminum conductors
» 100-amp sub panel with all necessary breakers included
»  Sub panel will have conduits ran to gutter in ceiling
»  MC cable will be used throughout walls and ceiling
General:
»  Normal business hours
Exclusions:
» Overtime
»  Network switch
» Taxes
»  Anything not mentioned above

This pricing is valid for thirty days.
Base price: $18,361.00

Acceptance Signature:

Date:




4 ) 4

e .y B W B A
IS $ TEEEES $EE W I S A -
ELECTRICAL, INC.

INDUSTRIAL POWER AND AUTOMATION & COMMERCIAL _ =
ELECTRICAL CONTRACTING LICENSED AND IMSURED FUIDABEH FSSR3000

PRICE QUOTATION

Date: 7/1/2024

Company: City of Willard

Contact: Public Works Department

From: Richard Magruder

Ref: City of Willard — Shop and Offices

Project Quote #: LS-24-124

Quotes Includes: Labor and material for the following

Office Electrical
e  Labor Rough in and wire 34 Can Lights
e  Labor for Interior Wall Rough in Receptacles and Data as per Drawing
e  Labor and Materials 100 Amp Panel Fed from Shop Building
e  Electrical Materials for Wall and Ceilings Rough In
1. All required Electrical and Data Locations on Sheet Provided by City
2. Power to Dedicated Equipment (Fridge, Microwave, ETC)
3.  Power to Relocated PTAC Unit
4. Exterior GFCI
e Lighting and Panel Materials
*Al| office receptacles will be Double Duplex except for Dedicated Duplexes for Fixed Equipment

Shop Electrical
s Demo Shop Electrical to bring up to code.

e Install 10 New LED High Bays (Lights Included)
e  Shop (3) Welding Receptacles (6) Duplex and MISC

Total: TBD upon Approvals
*Work can be done T&M if approved, Scope details can be Broken out if required.

NET DUE UPON RECEIPT OF INVOICE

119 West Center ST
P.O. Box 475
Rogersville MO 65742
Richard Magruder
Stephen G. Magruder

Fax 417-753-3398

$4,658.00
$3,625.00
$4,414.00
$4,950.26

$2,880.00

$3,900.00
$4,750.36
$4,680.00

All material is guaranteed to be as specified. All work to be completed in a workman-like manner according to standard practices.
Any alteration or deviation from the above specifications involving extra cost will be executed only upon written orders, and will
become an extra charge over and above the estimate. All agreements contingent upon necessary insurance. Our workers are fully

covered by Workman's Compensation Insurance.

Acceptance of Price Quote:

Date of Acceptance:




i CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 4177423033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Iltem #17

414 East Jackson Legal Description

Contract for Wilson Surveying

#
_—
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



Wilson Surveying Company

Surveying, Engineering & Land Marsing

1835 S Stewart, Suite 124
Springfield, Missouri 65804
417-522-7870

WORK ORDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

July 1, 2024

City of Willard

c¢/o Mike Ruesch Via Email: Planning@CityofWillard.com
Director of Planning & Development

PO Box 187

Willard, MO 65781

Dear Mr. Ruesch;
Thank you for contacting Wilson Surveying Company for a boundary survey for the project at:

Property Boundary Survey for Lot Line Adjustment & Sale of 414 E. Jackson, Willard,
Missouri;
The cost will be $3,000.

This project will be Invoiced shortly before completion. Invoices are due upon receipt. Two
hard-copies and a PDF of Plat of Survey are provided upon Payment In Full. Invoices
remaining unpaid after 30 days are subject to a monthly charge of 1%. Projects remaining
unpaid 90 days after invoicing may be subject to a mechanics lien.

Please let us know if you have any questions. Please sign this acknowledgement below and
return it to our office.

Sincerely, Acknowledgement/Notice to Proceed:

Rick Wilson

Rick Wilson, Professional Surveyor
Wilson Surveying Company City of Willard Date




s CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.0.Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Item #18

Legal Description Contract for Easements and Roadway
for AB Highway Starting at EE South to
Highway 266/Farm Road 91

#
-_—
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



Wilson Surveying Company

Surveying, Engineering & Lund Planning

1835 S Stewart, Suite 124
Springfield, Missouri 65804
417-522-7870

WORK ORDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

July 1, 2024

City of Willard
c/o Mike Ruesch Via Email: Planning@CityofWillard.com

Director of Planning & Development
PO Box 187
Willard, MO 65781

Dear Mr. Ruesch;

Thank you for contacting Wilson Surveying Company for a boundary survey for the pfoject at:
Right of Way, AB Hwy to Railroad/Elwood, Willard, Missouri,

The cost will be $5,000.

This project will be Invoiced shortly before completion. Invoices are due upon receipt. Two
hard-copies and a PDF of Plat of Survey are provided upon Payment In Full. Invoices
remaining unpaid after 30 days are subject to a monthly charge of 1%. Projects remaining
unpaid 90 days after invoicing may be subject to a mechanics lien.

Please let us know if you have any questions. Please sign this acknowledgement below and
return it to our office.

Sincerely, Acknowledgement/Notice to Proceed:

Rick Wilson

Rick Wilson, Professional Surveyor
Wilson Surveying Company City of Willard Date




=2 &
Wilson Surveving Company

Surveying, Engineering & Land Mitstning

1835 S Stewart, Suite 124
Springfield, Missouri 65804
417-522-7870

WORK ORDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

July 1, 2024

City of Willard
¢/o Mike Ruesch Via Email: Planning@CityofWillard.com

Director of Planning & Development
PO Box 187
Willard, MO 65781

Dear Mr. Ruesch;

Thank you for contacting Wilson Surveying Company for a boundary survey (#2) for the
project at:

Right of Way, AB Hwy/Railroad@Elwood to Hwy 266, Willard, Missouri;
The cost will be $5,000.

This project will be Invoiced shortly before completion. Invoices are due upon receipt. Two
hard-copies and a PDF of Plat of Survey are provided upon Payment In Full. Invoices
remaining unpaid after 30 days are subject to a monthly charge of 1%. Projects remaining
unpaid 90 days after invoicing may be subject to a mechanics lien.

Please let us know if you have any questions. Please sign this acknowledgement below and
return it to our office.

Sincerely, Acknowledgement/Notice to Proceed:

Rick Wilson

Rick Wilson, Professional Surveyor
Wilson Surveying Company City of Willard Date




Surveying, Engineering & Land Planning

1835 S Stewart, Suite 124
Springfield, Missouri 65804
417-522-7870

WORK ORDER ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

July 1, 2024

City of Willard

¢/o0 Mike Ruesch Via Email: Planning@CityofWillard.com
Director of Planning & Development

PO Box 187

Willard, MO 65781

Dear Mr. Ruesch;

Thank you for contacting Wilson Surveying Company for a boundary survey (#2) for the
project at:

Right of Way/Farm Road 99-Hwy 266 to I-44, Willard, Missouri;
The cost will be $6,000.

This project will be Invoiced shortly before completion. Invoices are due upon receipt. Two
hard-copies and a PDF of Plat of Survey are provided upon Payment In Full. Invoices
remaining unpaid after 30 days are subject to a monthly charge of 1%. Projects remaining
unpaid 90 days after invoicing may be subject to a mechanics lien.

Please let us know if you have any questions. Please sign this acknowledgement below and
return it to our office.

Sincerely, Acknowledgement/Notice to Proceed:

Rick Wilson

Rick Wilson, Professional Surveyor
Wilson Surveying Company City of Willard Date




e CITY OF WILLARD, MISSOURI

224 W. Jackson Street  P.O. Box 187  Willard, MO 65781 417-742-3033  417-742-3080 Fax

Agenda Item #19

Otrdinance to Amend Chapter 500 — Building Code and
Building Regulations of the Willard Code, by Adopting the
International Code Council 2018 Codes as Supplemented or

Amended and the 2017 NEC Codes as Supplemented or

Amended. (2nd Read)

_ e e—————
07/08/2024 BOA Meeting Agenda



First Reading: 6-24-2024

Second Reading: 07-08-2024
Ordinance No  240624A

Council Bill No.: _24-26

An Ordinance to amend Chapter 500 — Building Code and Building Regulations of
the Willard Code, by adopting the International Code Council 2018 Codes as supplemented

or amended and the 2017 NEC Code as supplemented or amended.

WHEREAS, the Board of Aldermen of the City of Willard, Missouri (the “Board”), has
determined that certain updates and charges are necessary in their building codes and

regulations; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Aldermen should review and adjust the building codes and

regulations as they are updated and when deemed necessary

BE IT ORDAINED AND RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF ALDERMEN OF
THE CITY OF WILLARD, GREENE COUNTY, MISSOURI as follows:

SECTION I: The publication known as the International Code Council 2018 codes;
International Building Code, Intemational Residential Code, International Plumbing Code,
International Mechanical Code, International Fuel Gas Code, International Fire Code,
International Energy Conservation Code, International Existing Building Code, International
Property Maintenance code and the 2017 National Electrical Code, as published by the
‘Intemational Code Council, Inc., and the National Fire Protection Association and is hereby
referred to, adopted and made part hereof as if fully set out in ordinance, with the additions,
insertions, deletions and changes, prescribed in the attachment to this ordinance as Exhibit A.

SECTION II: That all previous ordinances 500.010 to 500.105 are repealed and replaced

with the ordinances prescribed and set out in full in Exhibit A.

SECTION III: That all other ordinances and codes or parts of ordinances or codes in



conflict are hereby repealed.
SECTION IV: This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after the date of

its passage by the Board of Alderman and approval of the Mayor.

Read two times and passed at meeting:

Approved as to form:

City Attorney

Attested by: Approved by:

Janice Gargus, City Clerk Troy Smith, Mayor



EXHIBIT "A"

Article I
International Building Code

Section 500.010 Adoption Of International Building Code. (IBC)
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file and open for public inspection in the office of the City
Clerk of the City of Willard, Missouri, being marked and designated as the International Building Code 2018,
including Appendices A, C, D, E, F, G, H, I and J as published by the International Code Council, be and is
hereby adopted as the Building Code of the City of Willard for the control of buildings and structures as
herein provided; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said code
are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Chapter, with the additions,
insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 500.015 of this Chapter.

Section 500.015 Additions, Insertions And Changes.
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A. The International Building Code 2018 adopted by Section 500.010 is hereby amended by substituting
the following Sections or portions of Sections for those Sections or portions of Sections with
corresponding numbers of the International Building Code 2018, or where there is no corresponding
Section in the code, the following Sections shall be enacted as additions to the code.

1. Section 101.1 Insert: "The City of Willard."

2. Fee "as adopted by City of Willard."

3. Section 114.4 Violation Penalties. Is hereby amended to add an additional sentence to the end of the
paragraph as follows: "The penalties are set forth in Section 500.150 of the Code of Ordinances of the

City of Willard."

4. Section 114.3 is amended to add an additional sentence to the end of the paragraph as follows: "The
penalties are set forth in Section 500.150 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard."

5. Delete Section 1608.2 in its entirety and add in its place a new Section 1608.2 to read as follows:
"1608.2 Ground Snow Load: The ground snow load for the City of Willard, Missouri, shall be a
minimum of twenty (20) pounds per square foot."

6. Section 1612.3 Insert: "City of Willard."
7. Section 1612.3 Insert: "as adopted by the City of Willard."

8. Section 423 is amended to include the following addition: Section 423.4.3 Group E Occupancy
Campuses: Where a Group E Occupancy building having an aggregate occupant load of 50 or more is added
to an existing Group E occupancy campus, a storm shelter complying with ICC 500 and capable of housing
the total occupant load of all the Group E Occupancy buildings on campus shall be installed when the
additional building increases the floor area of the classrooms, vocational rooms, and offices of the campus by

more than 25%.



Article II
International Residential Code

Section 500.020 Adoption Of International Residential Code.(IRC)
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file and open for public inspection in the office of the City
Clerk of the City of Willard, Missouri, being marked and designated as the International Residential Code
2018, including Appendices A, B, C,D, E, G, H, J, K, M, N and Q as published by the International Code
Council, be and is hereby adopted as the Residential Code of the City of Willard for regulating the design,
construction, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement,
addition to, use or maintenance of one- and two-family dwellings and town houses not more than three (3)
stories in height in the City of Willard; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions
and terms of said code are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this
Chapter, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 500.025 of this

Chapter.

Section 500.025 Additions, Insertions And Changes.
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A. The International Residential Code 2018 adopted by Section 500.020 is hereby amended by substituting
the following Sections or portions of Sections for those Sections or portions of Sections with
corresponding numbers of the International Residential Code 2018, or where there is no corresponding
Section in the code, the following Sections shall be enacted as additions to the code.

Refer to the” City of Willard Missouri One & Two Family Residential Requirements” (IRC 2018)
Revised March 2024

1. Section R101.1 Insert: "The City of Willard."

2. Section R103 "Department of Building Safety." Delete in its entirety. Insert, in lieu thereof, the
following: "Refer to Section 103 of the International Building Code."

3. Section R113.4. Add a sentence to the end of the paragraph to read as follows: "The penalties are set
forth in Section 500.150 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard."

4, [Insert the following values in Table R301.2(1):



Insert the following values in Table R301.2(1):

Climate Zone 4A

Ground Snow Load 20 PSF

Wind Speed (mph) *d 115 MPH

Seismic Design Category B

Weathering *a Severe

Frost Line Depth *b 18 Inches

Termite *c Moderate to Heavy

Decay Slight to Moderate

Ice Shield Underlayment No

Required

Flood Hazard*g As adopted by City of Willard
Air Freezing Index 659

Winter Design Temp 9°F

Air Freezing Index 1500 or less

Mean Annual Temp 56°F

Elevation 1237 feet

Latitude 37°N. 93°W

Winter Heating 11°F

Summer Cooling 92°F

Altitude Correction Factor 0.96

Indoor Design Temperature 70°F

Wind Velocity Heating 15 mph if site specific speed unknown
Wind Velocity Cooling 15 mph if site specific speed unknown
Coincident Wet Bulb 74°F

Daily Range M

For S 1 paund per square foot = 0.0479 kPa. 1 mile per hour = 0.447 nvs.
a Where wealhering requires a hlgher strength e or grade of y than y to sallsfy the slructural requirements of Ihis code, the frost line depth sirength

required for weathering shall govern. The weathering cofumn shad be filed in with the weathering index, negligibte,' ‘maderale’ or “severe” for concrete as determined frorm
Figurs R301.2(4). The grade of masonry unfts shall be determined from ASTM C34, G55, 62, C73, €80, C129, C145, G216 or CB52.
b. Where the frosl line depth requires deeper Toolings than indicated in Figure RA403.1(1;, the frost Bne depth strength required for wealhering shall govem, The Jurizdiction shall il
in the frast line depth column wih tha minimum depth of faoling below fintsh grads.
 The jurisdiction shall fill In this pan of the {able lo indicate the need for proteciion depending on whether (hete has been a history of local subtemranean termite damage.
d. The jurisdiction shall fll in this part of the lable with the wind speed from the basic wind speed map [Figure R301.2(5)A]. Wind exposte category shall be determined on 3 site-
specific basis in accordance with Seclion R3012.14.
o The autdoor design dry-bulb lemperature shall be selacted from e columns: of §7',-percant values for vinter from Appendix D of the internstional Fiymbing Code Devialions
fiom the Appendix D femperatures shall be penmitted fo reflect local cllmates or local weather experience as delermined by the building official [Afso see Figure R/301.2(1)]
1. The jurisdiction shall fill in this parl of the table with the seismic design category tetermined from Section R301.2.2.1
¢ The risdiction shall @! in this part of the table with (a) the date of the jurisdiction's entry Info the National Flood Irsurance Program {date of adoption of the first code or
ordinance for managament of flood hazard areas), (b) the dale(s) of ihe Flood Insurance Study and {c) the panel numbers and dates of the currently effeclive FIRMs and
FBFMs or other fload hazard map adapied by the authorily having Jurisdiction, a3 amended.
+. In accordance with Sections R805.1.2, R905.4.3.1, R905.5.3,1, R905.6.3.1, R805.7,3.1 and R905 8.3.1. where fhere has beaen a history of local damage rom the effects of ice
damming.- the jurisdiction shall fifi tn this part of the table with “YES * Otherwise, the jurisdiction shall fill in this part of the table wilh "NO."
.. The jurietiction shali il in this parf of Ihe lable vath the 100-yoar setum perod air freezing Index (BF-days) from Figure R403.3(2) or from the 100-year (99 parcent) valus on ihe
Nalional CEmatic Dzta Center data table “Air Freezing Index-USA Method (Base 32°F)."
1 The jurisdiction shall il in this past of the fable with the mean annual temperalurs from Ihe National Climatic Data Cenler dala table “Alr Freezing Ingex-USA
32°F)*
& In accordance with Section R301.2.1 5, where tiere i& focal historical data documenting structural damage (o buildings due lo lopographic wind speed-up effecis, the
jurisdiction shall fit in this part of the labte with “YES " Othenvise, the jurisdiction shall indicate "NO" in this past of the table
L In accordance with Figure R301.2($)A. where ltere is local historical data documenting unusual wind canditions, the jurisdiction shat fill in Ihls parf of the tabie with “YES" and
idenlify any specific requirements. Otherwige. the jurisdiclion shall indicate “NO" this parl of the lable
m In accordance vAlh Section R301.2 1 2 the jurisdiction shall indicale the wind-borne debris wind zone(s) Othenwise, the Jurisdiction shail indicate “NO* n this part of the (abte.
o. The jurisdicion shall T In thase sections of ihe fable to establish the design criteria using Table 12 or 1b from ACCA Manual J or esfablished criteria detemiined by the
jurtsdiction
o. The jurisdiction shall fill in this secton of the table using the Ground Snow Loads in Figure R301 2(8).

ethod (Base




1. Storage areas accessible from the exterior of the residence shall meet the requirements for
dwelling/garage opening/penetration protection. R302.5 in the 2018 IRC.

2. Delete Section R302.13 Fire Protection of floors, in its entirety.

3. Amend Section R313 'Automatic Fire Sprinkler Systems' by deleting sub-section R313 in its entirety
and enacting a new subsection which said new subsection shall read as follows: R313 Automatic Fire
Sprinkler Systems. A builder of five or more connected units shall comply with the design and

installation requirements of the 2012 International Residential Code suppressant separation as
provided in Section R317 of the 2006 IRC or Section P2904 of the 2012 IRC at the builder's or

purchaser's cost and option.
4. Repeal Section R315, Carbon monoxide alarms, subsection R315.3, as follows, where required in
existing dwellings, in its entirety, and provide a new subsection R315.3 as follows:

5. R315.3 alterations and addition. When alterations or additions requiring a permit occur, or when one
or more sleeping rooms are added or created in existing dwellings, the individual dwelling unit shall

be equipped with carbon monoxide alarms as required for new dwellings.

Exceptions:

a. Work involving the exterior surfaces of dwellings such as the replacement of roofing or
siding, or the addition or replacement of windows or doors, or the addition of a porch or deck,

are exempt from the requirements of this section.
b. Installation, alteration, or repairs of plumbing or mechanical systems are exempt from the
requirements of this section.

6. R403.1.7.3 Foundation Elevation. The foundation stem wall / slab elevation shall be a minimum of eighteen
(18) inches above the street curb top of elevation.



Foundations and Footings

The minimum dimensions for foolings are based on {oading and an assumed allowable sof pressure of 2,000 pounds per
square foot. Footing widths or the depth of foolings beiow natural grade may have to be Increased if the supporting soil is of a
type not having an allowable bearing pressure of at least 2,000 pounds per square foot.

Depth: Footings are to be poured on a saolid bearing surface. The bearing surface shall be a minimum of 18 inches below
finished grade.

Table R403.1 = Minimum Widthof Concrete. Precast or Masonry Footine finches®)

toad Bearmp of Soil {psf)

1500 2000 1000 SAQ0M0

Conventional Light Frama Construction

1 Story 12 12 12 12

2 Story 16 12 12 12

3 Stary 24 17 12 12

‘&fch Brick Veneer Over Light Frame or, 8-inch Hollow Canarete Masonry

1 Story 12 12 12 12

2 Story 249 16 12 12

3 Story 32 24 16 12
B-nch Solid or Fully Grouted Masonry

1 Story 16 12 12 12

2 Story 30 21 14 12

3 Story 42 32 21 16

a.  Where minimum footing width is 12 inches. use of a sing’e wythe of solid or fully grouted 12-inch nominal concrefe masonry units is permittagd

General (R403.1): All exterior walls shall be supported on coninucus solid or fully grouted masonry or concrete footings,
crushed stone footings, wood foundations, or other approved structural sysfems which shall be of sufficient design to
accommodate all loads according to Section R301 and te transmit the resutting foads to the soil within the limitations as
determined from the chamacter of the soil. Footings shall be supperted on undisturbed natural soils or engingered fill. Concrete
footing shall be deslgned and constructed in accordance with the provisions of Section R403 or in accordance with ACE 332.
Minimum size (R403:1.1): Minimum sizes for concrete and masonry footings shall be as set forth in Table R403.1 and Figure
R403.1(1). The footing width, W, shaill be based on the load-bearing value of the soil in accordance with Table R401.4.1.
Spread footings shall be at least 6 inchea in thickness, T. Footing projections, P, shall be at least 2 inches and shall nct exceed
the thickness of the footing. The size of footings supporting piers and columms shall ba based on the tributary load and
allowable scil pressure in accordance with Table R401.4.1. Footings for wood foundations shall be in accerdance with the

detsils set forth in Section R403.2; and Figures R403.1(2) and R403.1(3).
Stope (R403:1.5): The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings shall not have a slope exceeding

one unit vertical in 10 unils horizontal {(10-percent slope). Footings shall be stepped where itia necessary to change the
elevation of the top surface of the {ootings or where the slope of the bottom surface of the foctings will exceed one unit vertical

in ten units horizontal {10-percent slope).

Horizontalk: A minimum of 2 strands of ¥ rebar (#4) placed three (3) inches from the side and located in the bottom third of the
footing. Jomts are to be lapped and Gied a minimum of fifteen (15) inches. Rebar must be supported on steel chairs or wick ets
designed for that purpose.

Vertical; A minimum of one (1) % -inch {#4) rebar every 6 feet, extending vertcally from the feoting and terminating within 3-
inches of the top of the foundation wall. Vertical stee! may be placed in footings before the concrete sets or drifled in place
Defore the faundation wall forms are placed.

Exception: Verticat steel Is not required in foundation walls less.then 24 inches high.

Foundation Drains Drains shall be provided around all foundations. Drainage tiles, gravel or crushed stone drains,
perforated pipe or other approved systems or materials shall be installed at or below the area to be protected and shall
discharge by gravity or mechanical means into an approved drainage system. Gravel or crushed stone drains shall extend
at least 1 foot beyond the outside edge of the footing and 6 inches above the top of the footing and be covered with an
approved filter membrane material. The top of open joints of drain tiles shall be protected with strips of building paper.
Perforated drains shall be surrounded with an approved filter membrane or the filter membrane shall cover the washed
gravel or crushed rock covering the drain. Drainage tiles or perforated pipe shall be placed on a minimum of 2 inches of
washed gravel or crushed rock at least one sieve size larger than the tile joint opening or perforation and covered with not
less than 6 inches of the same material. -

Exception: A drainage system is not required when the foundation is installed on well-drained ground or sand -
gravel mixture soils as defined by the Unified soils classification system( Group I Soils) See IRC 2012 R405.1



10.
11.

8.

12

13.

14.

15.

Repeal Section R507, Decks subsection 507.3.1 and 507.3.2 and provide new subsection 507.3.1 and

507.3.2 as follows:
a. Exterior footings shall be placed not less than 12 inches below the undisturbed ground
surface.
18" below finished grade.
Ledger shall be attached with lag screws or bolts per R-507.2.1(1)
20" square or 20" round diameter
Post size shall be 6 x 6 and a maximum height shall be 14'0".

f. Exception: landings and decks less than 30" in height can use 4 x 4 post.

e o

Repeal Section 802.11 Roof Tie-Down subsection
Section 802.11.1 in its entirety and provide a new subsection R802.11.1 as follows:

802.11.1 Uplift resistance, by adding the following; All rafters and trusses spaced not more than 24
inches on center shall be attached to their supporting wall assemblies by mechanical fasteners.

Firewall Rated Construction:

Townhouses (R302): Each townhouse shall be considered a separate building and shall be separated by
fire-resistance-rated wall assemblies meeting the requirements of Section R302.1 for exterior walls & common
walls. The common wall shall be a two (2) hour block fire wall from the top of the concrete footing
continuously up to the underside of the roof decking material. The roof decking material shall be
fire-retardant-treated wood for a distance of four (4) feet on each side of the wall with no penetrations through

the sheathing.
Continuity (R302.2.1): The fire-resistance-rated wall or assembly separating townhouses shall be continuous

from the foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing, deck or slab. The fire-resistance rating shall extend
the full length of the wall or assembly, including wall extensions through and separating attached enclosed
accessory structures.

The fire wall shall be labeled under the floor and in the attic area, in letters at least two (2) inches in height,
stating “FIRE WALL: DO NOT PENETRATE OR DAMAGE” “No Penetrar O Dafiar esta Pared Resistente al
Fuego”.

Chapter 11 Energy Efficiency. Repeal the language and all related references to this Chapter in the code and
provide new language as follows:

Section N1101 Certificate. A permanent certificate shall be posted completed by the building or registered
design professional. The certificate shall list the predominant R-values of insulation installed in or on the
ceiling/roof, walls, foundation (slab, basement wall, crawlspace wall and/or floor), and ducts outside
conditioned spaces; U-factors for fenestration; and solar heat gain coefficient (SHGC) of fenestration. Where
there is more than one (1) value for each component, the certificate shall list the value covering the largest area.
The certificate shall list the type and efficiency of heating, cooling and service water heating equipment.

Section M1600 Ducts. Supply and return air ducts in attics shall be insulated to a minimum of R-8, and in
other areas a minimum of R-6.



16.

Section N1102 Minimum Insulation And Fenestration Requirements By Component. Unfinished areas
and areas without heating or cooling shall be exempt from the requirements,

Component insulation requirements for Climate Group 4A per 2012 IECC

17.

18.

19.

20.

21.

22.

23.

24.

25.

Fenestration U Factor =0.35
Exception Skylights: Skylight U Factor = 0.60
Glazed Fenestration SHGC=NR- Applies to all Glazing
Attic=R-38
Wood Frame Wall R-Value= R-20 or R-13+3.8 - Cavity insulation - 13, continuous insulation is R-5 -1” Foam
Floors =R-19
Floor Cantilever =R-19

Basement Walls when finished = R-10/R-13 - 10/13 means r-10 continuous insulation on the interior or exterior of the
building or r-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall

Slab = R-10 for 24” - 2” foam for two (2) feet
Crawl Space =R-10/13

M1411.3 Condensate Disposal. Amend as follows: Condensate shall not discharge into a building drain or
sewer line, street, alley, or other area where it would cause a nuisance.

M1501.1 Outdoor Discharge. Exception 2. Mechanical exhaust from bathroom exhaust fans may be permitted
to exhaust through the soffit provided that the duct shall terminate at the soffit pane with an approved
mechanical louver or vent and the adjoining soffit space, for a distance of four (4) feet on either side of the
penetration, shall be solid non-vented material.

G2412.1 Scope. Amend as follows: This Section shall govern the design, installation, modification, and
maintenance of piping systems. The applicability of this code to piping extends from the point of delivery to
the connections with the appliances and includes the design, materials, components, fabrication, assembly,
installation, testing, inspection, operation, and maintenance of such piping system. The utility company gas
meter location shall be in accordance with the requirements of the utility company.

G2414.5.3 Copper Or Copper-Alloy Tubing. Repeal this Section in its entirety.

G2417.4.1 Test Pressure. Delete in its entirety and provide new language as follows: The test pressure of the
piping system for 2-pound gas pressure shall be twenty (20) psi.

G2417.4.2 Test Duration. Amend as follows: The test duration shall be not less than fifteen (15) minutes.

Chapter 25 — Plumbing

a. Delete Section P2503.5.2 item 2 in its entirety.
b. Delete Section P2503.6
c. Residential Service Upgrades,

P2603.6 Pipe Tracing. All water service piping and building sewer piping shall be installed with a #14 tracer
wire attached to the pipe from the point of connection to the water meter or sewer lateral to the point of

entrance of the building.

P2905 Heated Water Distribution Systems. Delete this Section in its entirety.



26.

P3303.1.5 Ground Water Required Discharge. Add the new Section as follows: A crawl space perimeter
drain shall be installed along the outside of the crawlspace footing. The drain shall daylight and discharge a
minimum of 10 feet from the building

Chapter 39 — Electrical

Al

28.

29.

30.
31.

32.

33.

34.

35.
36.

37.

38.

All structures used for residential purposes, requiring a service upgrade or modification, shall
mandate the following electrical system improvements:
GFI receptacles in the kitchen(s) and bathroom(s) shall be installed if outlets are in existence at the
time of the service upgrade.
Approved hard-wired, dual powered, interconnected smoke detectors shall be installed and located as
per the adopted building code.
The kitchen shall be provided with a minimum of two (2) 20 amp GFCI Circuits
If a fire occurs, or other similar incident that damages any part of the electrical system within a
residential structure, in addition to all damaged systems being repaired, it is mandated that all
apparent hazards within the structure be corrected. Hard-wired, dual-powered, interconnected smoke
detectors shall be installed and located as per the adopted building codes. If a service portion of the
electrical system is damaged or upgraded as a result of a fire or other incident, it shall require that all
affected electrical components be brought up to current code standards
A total partial upgrade of the electrical system may be required, if in the opinion of the Code Official,
or his designee, the condition of the existing electrical system constitutes a potential threat to the
safety and welfare of current or future occupants.
Amend Section E3902, Ground-fault and arc-fault circuit-interrupter protection, subsection E3902.2,
Garage and accessory building receptacles, as follows:
E3902.2 Garage and accessory building receptacles. All 125-bolt, single phase, 15-0r20- amp
receptacles installed in garages and grade-level portions of unfinished accessory buildings used for
storage or work areas shall have ground fault circuit-interrupter protection for personnel.

a. Exception: The receptacle adjacent to and used solely for the purpose of providing power for

the garage door opener does not have be GFCI protected.

Amend Section E3902, Ground-fault and arc fault circuit-interrupter protection, as follows:
E3902.12 Arc-fault circuit-interrupter protection. All branch circuits that supply 120+volt,
single-phase, 15-and 20-ampere bedroom circuits
Repeal Section E4002, Receptacles, subsection E4002. 14, Tamper-resistant receptacles, in its entirety.

Sec. 36-1303. Adoption Of Appendices. Only the following appendices, listed among others in the 2018
International Residential Code, are adopted.

Appendix A. Sizing and Capacities of Gas Piping
Appendix B. Sizing of Venting Systems Serving Appliances Equipped with Draft Hoods, Category-I Appliances, and
Appliances Listed for use with Type B Vents

Appendix C. Exit Terminals of Mechanical Draft and Direct-Vent Venting Systems

Appendix D, Recommended Procedure for Safety Inspection of an Existing Appliance Installation
Appendix E. Manufactured Housing used as Dwellings.

Appendix G. Piping Standards for Various Applications

Appendix L Private Sewage Disposal

Appendix J. Existing Building and Structures

Appendix P. Sizing of Water Piping System



Article IIT
Electrical Code

Section 500.030 Adoption Of The National Electric Code.(NEC)
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file and open for public inspection in the office of the City
Clerk of the City of Willard, Missouri, being marked and designated as the National Electric Code (NEC)
2017, be and is hereby adopted and known as the Electric Code of the City of Willard. For the purpose of
establishing rules and regulations for the design, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation,
replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of electrical systems in the City of Willard; and each and all of
the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said code are hereby referred to, adopted and
made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this Chapter, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if

any, prescribed in Section 500.035 of this Chapter.

Section 500.035 Additions, Insertions And Changes.
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A. The National Electric Code (NEC)/2017 adopted by Section 500.030 is hereby amended by substituting
the following Sections or portions of Sections for those Sections or portions of Sections with
corresponding numbers of the National Electric Code (NEC)/2017, or where there is no corresponding
Section in the code, the following Sections shall be enacted as additions to the code.

It shall be unlawful for any person to install, or permit the installation of, any electrical wiring, equipment, or
apparatus within the corporate limits of the City of Willard, unless the same shall be installed to conform
with the standards and provisions of the 2017 NEC, the latest approved edition of the Electrical Service
Standards of City Utilities of Springfield, and all other applicable City codes and ordinances. In the event of
a conflict between these documents the most stringent or restrictive shall govern, or an administrative
interpretation may be made by the Director of Building Development Services to resolve such conflicts.

210.8 Ground-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection for Personnel

Dwelling Units, All 125-volt, single-phase, 15- or 20-ampere receptacles installed in locations specified in
210.8(A)(1) through (10) shall have ground-fault circuit-interrupter protection for personnel.
1. Garages and accessory buildings that have a floor located at or below grade level and are: not
intended as habitable rooms; and, limited to storage areas, work areas, and areas of similar use
a. Exception to (2): A single receptacle installed solely for electrical supply of a garage door

opener.

210.12 Arc-Fault Circuit-Interrupter Protection
Dwelling Units. All 120-volt, single phase, 15- and 20-ampere branch circuits supplying outlets or devices

installed in dwelling unit bedrooms, shall be protected by any of the means described in 210.12(A)(1)
through (6).
210.52 Dwelling Unit Receptacle Outlets.

Basements, Garages, and Accessory Buildings.
Basements. In each separate, unfinished portion of a basement, framed, interior walls for separate rooms

constitute finished areas and, therefore, must have branch circuits as required by Article 210, and any
required smoke detectors. All wiring must be protected from physical damage by the wall framing or the wall
must be covered with sheetrock applied to at least one side of the wall.

230.11. Residential service upgrades and repairs.
In all structures used for residential purposes, a service upgrade or modification must include:



1. GFI receptacles in kitchen(s) and bathroom(s) if outlets are in existence at the time of the setvice
upgrade.

2. Approved hard-wired, dual-powered, interconnected smoke alarms installed and located per the
adopted building code;

3. A minimum of two (2) 20 amp grounded small appliance branch circuits in kitchens.

4. Carbon monoxide detectors installed according to R315.1 where the structure has an attached garage
or fuel-fired appliances; and,

5. Corrections to all apparent hazards.

Damage repair. If a fire or other similar incident damages any part of the electrical system within a
residential structure, the system, in addition to all damaged systems, must be completely repaired and:
1. All apparent hazards within the structure must be corrected.
2. Hard-wired, dual-powered, interconnected smoke detectors and carbon-monoxide detectors must be
installed and located per the adopted building codes.
3. A total or partial upgrade of the electrical system may be required if, in the opinion of an electrical
expert in the Department of Building Development Services, the condition of the existing electrical
system constitutes a potential threat to the safety and welfare of current or future occupants.

230.70 General,
Location.

Readily Accessible Location. The service disconnecting means shall be installed at a readily accessible
location either outside of a building or structure or inside nearest the point of entrance to the service
conductors. The maximum length of conduit between the meter back and service disconnect shall not exceed
36 inches, unless otherwise authorized by the Department of Building Development Services.

230.72 Grouping of Disconnects.
General. The two to six disconnects as permitted in 230.71 shall be grouped. The term "grouped" as used in

this sub-article is defined as being within two feet of each other, on the same wall, with no intervening
obstructions exceeding eight inches in depth from the wall surface, unless otherwise authorized by the
Department of Building Development Services prior to installation. Each disconnect shall be marked to

indicate the load served.

Article IV
International Plumbing Code

Section 500.040 Adoption Of International Plumbing Code.(IPC)
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file and open for public inspection in the office of the City
Clerk of the City of Willard, Missouri, being marked and designated as the International Plumbing Code
2018, including Appendices E and F, as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby
adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City of Willard for regulating the design, construction, quality of
materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or
maintenance of plumbing systems in the City of Willard; and each and all of the regulations, provisions,
penalties, conditions and terms of said code are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully
set out in this Chapter, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section
500.045 of this Chapter.



Section 500.045 Adoptions, Insertions and Changes.
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

The International Plumbing Code 2018 adopted by Section 500.040 is hereby amended by substituting the
following Sections or portions of Sections for those Sections or portions of Sections with corresponding
numbers of the International Plumbing Code 2018, or where there is no corresponding Section in the code,
the following Sections shall be enacted as additions to the code.

Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Willard."

Delete Sections 103.1, 103.2 and 103.3 in their entirety and insert, in lieu thereof, the following statement:
"See Chapter 1 of the International Building Code 2018"

106.6.3 "Fee Refunds" Delete the text in its entirety and insert the following statement: "See 109.6 of the
International Building Code 2018."

Delete the text of Section 108.4 in its entirety and add a statement, in lieu thereof, which shall read: "See
Section 500.150 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard."

108.5 by deleting the last sentence of that Section and adding, in lieu thereof, the following: "Any person
who shall continue any work on the system having been served with a stop work order, except such work as
that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable for a fine as
prescribed in Section 500,150 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard."

305.4.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers that connect to private-sewage-disposal systems shall be installed a minimum of 18
inches below finished grade at the point of septic-tank connection. Building sewers shall be installed not less than 12 inches

below grade.

312.1 Required tests. The permit holder shall make the applicable tests prescribed in Sections 312.2 through
312.10 to determine compliance with the provisions of this code. The permit holder shall give reasonable
advance notice to the code official when the plumbing work is ready for tests. The code official, or the code
official's duly authorized representative, may witness or require verification of these tests. The equipment,
material, power, and labor necessary for the inspection and test shall be furnished by the permit holder and he
or she shall be responsible for determining that the work will withstand the test pressure prescribed in the
following tests. Plumbing-system piping shall be tested with either water or, for piping systems other than
plastic, by air. After the plumbing fixtures have been set and their traps filled with water, the entire drainage
system shall be submitted to final tests. The code official shall require the removal of any cleanouts, if
necessary, to ascertain whether the pressure has reached all parts of the system.

Delete "Exceptions: 2 of Subsection 403.2, Separate facilities," in its entirety, and add the following: "2.
Separate facilities shall not be required in structures or tenant spaces with a total occupant load, including

both employees and customers, of forty-nine (49

403.2 Separate facilities. Where plumbing fixtures are required, separate facilities shall be provided for each sex.

Exceptions:
1.

Except for mercantile uses, occupancies which do not serve food or beverages to be consumed within the structure or tenant
space, do not require separate facilities when the total occupant load, including both employees and customers, does not

exceed 49.
In Section 410.3 Substitution, add the following: "Exception: In all use groups except Use Group A, where
the occupant load is less than forty-nine (49), a two- or five-gallon water dispenser or water cooler may be

substituted for the required drinking fountain,"



Section 504.7 Required pan.

Exceptions:
1. A pan will not be required if the floor is concrete and a floor drain is adjacent to the device or the floor is a

slab-on-grade, concrete floor.2.

2. A pan will not be required on a water heater changeout if the pre-existing conditions did not contain a pan.

604.8 Water pressure-reducing valve or regulator. An approved water-pressure-reducing valve conforming to ASSE
1003 with strainer shall be installed to reduce the pressure in the building water distribution piping to 80 psi (552 kPa)
static or less.

606.3 Access to valves. Ready access shall be provided to all required full-open valves and shutoff valves.

608.1 General. A potable water supply system shall be designed, installed, and maintained in such a manner so as to
prevent contamination from non-potable liquids, solids or gases being introduced into the potable and public water
supply through cross connections or any other piping connections to the system. Backflow preventer applications shall
conform to Table 608.1, except as specifically stated in Sections 608.2 through 608.17.10, and Missouri Department of
Natural Resources regulations for backflow prevention in effect at the time of installation; where requirements differ
the requirement that provides the highest level of protection shall govern. Installation of a backflow preventer is
required as a condition for new systems not governed by the residential code and for permitted modifications to an
existing system not governed by the residential code where more than four drainage fixture units, as defined in Table
709.1, are installed; the drainage fixture unit valve for a pot sink or three compartment sinks shall be defined as three
fixture units. This backflow preventer shall be installed as close as possible to the point where the potable water service
enters the building or as approved by the water purveyor. No branch lines or taps will be allowed between the water
meter and the backflow preventer, Backflow preventers shall be tested and tagged prior to final plumbing inspection.
608.17.4.2 Location. All required automatic fire sprinkler and standpipe system backflow preventers shall be
located in accordance with the requirements of the water purveyor. Location of backflow preventers shall be such that

ready access for service and testing is achieved.

608.18 Protection of individual water supplies. An individual water supply shall be located and constructed so as to be
safeguarded against contamination in accordance with standards established by the Springfield-Greene County Health
Department, the water purveyor, and/or the Missouri Department of Natural Resources, for all site requirements related
to protection of individual, water-supply systems. The more restrictive provisions specified for health, safety, and

welfare shall apply whenever a conflict exists.

802.1.7 Food utensils, dishes, pots-and-pans sinks. Sinks, in other than dwelling units, used for the washing, rinsing, or
sanitizing of utensils, dishes, pots, or pans; ot, service ware, used in the preparation, serving, or eating of food, shall
discharge indirectly through an air gap or an air break to the drainage system. The drainage system includes the grease

interceptor.

903.1 Roof extension. Open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be terminated not less than 12 inches above the
roof. Where a roof is to be used for assembly or as a promenade, observation deck, sunbathing deck, or similar
purposes, open vent pipes shall terminate not less than 7 feet (2134 mm) above the roof.

918.3 Where permitted. Individual, branch, and circuit vents shall be permitted to terminate with a connection to an
individual or branch-type-air-admittance valve in accordance with Section 918.3.1 only with approval from the code
official or the code official's duly authorized representative, prior to design or installation. Stack vents and vent stacks
shall be permitted to terminate to stack-type-air-admittance valves in accordance with Section 918.3.2 only with
approval from the code official or the code official's duly authorized representative prior to design or installation. The
use of air-admittance valves shall be permitted only in the remodel of existing buildings and shall not be permitted in
new structures and building additions, except for island fixtures, unless otherwise approved by the code official or the
code official's duly authorized representative, prior to design or installation. Requests for approval shall be submitted

separately in writing.

1003.3 Grease interceptors. Grease interceptors shall comply with the requirements of Sections 1003.3.1 through
1003.3.8 and the requirements and guidelines of the City of Springfield Fats, Oils, and Grease ("FOG") Management
Plan, based on the anticipated conditions of use, and shall be subject to the approval of Clean Water Services.

1003.3.1 Grease interceptors and automatic grease removal devices required. A grease interceptor or an automatic,
grease-removal device shall be required to receive the drainage from fixtures and equipment with grease-laden waste



located in food preparation areas, such as in restaurants, hotel kitchens, hospitals, school kitchens, bars, factory
cafeterias, daycare centers, and clubs. Fixtures and equipment shall include: mop sinks; kitchen floor drains and sinks;
culinary sinks; hand sinks; pot sinks; pre rinse sinks; soup kettles or similar devices; wok stations; floor drains or sinks
into which kettles are drained; automatic hood wash units and dishwashers without pre rinse sinks. Grease interceptors
and automatic grease removal devices shall receive waste only from fixtures and equipment that allow fats, oils, or
grease to be discharged. Where the lack of space or other constraints prevent the installation or replacement of a grease
interceptor, one or more grease interceptors shall be permitted to be installed on or above the floor and upstream of an

existing grease interceptor.

1003.3.2 Food waste disposers restriction. A food-waste disposer shall discharge to a grease interceptor through a
solids separator.

1003.3.3 Additives to grease interceptors. Dispensing systems that dispense interceptor performance additives to a
grease interceptor shall not be installed. Systems that discharge emulsifiers, chemicals or enzymes to grease

interceptors are prohibited.

1003.3.7 Gravity grease interceptors and gravily grease interceplors with fats, oils, and greases disposal systems. The
required capacity of gravity grease interceptors and gravity grease interceptors with fats, oils, and greases disposal
systems shall be determined by multiplying the peak drain flow into the interceptor in gallons per minute by a retention
time of 30 minutes. Gravity grease interceptors shall be designed and tested in accordance with IAPMO/ANSI Z1001,
Gravity grease interceptors with fats, oils, and greases disposal systems shall be designed and tested in accordance with
ASME A112.14.6 and IAPMO/ANSI Z1001. Gravity grease interceptors and gravity grease interceptors with fats, oils,
and greases disposal systems shall be installed in accordance with manufacturer’s instructions, Where manufacturer's

instructions are not provided, gravity grease interceptors and gravity grease interceptors with fats, oils, and greases
disposal systems shall be installed in compliance with ASME Al 12.14.6 and IAPMO/ANSI ZIOOI. Concrete grease

interceptors are prohibited.

1003.11 Sampling manhole. A sampling manhole shall be installed for all required interceptors in accordance with City
of Willard Public Works standard details to monitor the entire building, or to monitor individual tenant space as

determined by Clean Water Services.

Article V
International Mechanical Code

Section 500.050 Adoption Of International Mechanical Code. aMcoe)
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

A certain document, one (1) copy of which is on file and open for public inspection in the office of the City
Clerk of the City of Willard, Missouri, being marked and designated as the International Mechanical Code
2018, including Appendix A, as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the
Mechanical Code of the City of Willard for regulating the design, construction, quality of materials, erection,
installation, alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of
mechanical systems in the City of Willard; and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties,
conditions and terms of said code are hereby referred to, adopted and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in
this Chapter, with the additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 500.055 of
this Chapter.

Section 500.055 Additions, Insertions And Changes.
[Ord. No. 170213A § 2, 2-27-2017]

The International Mechanical Code 2018 adopted by Section 500.050 is hereby amended by substituting the
following Sections or portions of Sections for those Sections or portions of Sections with corresponding
numbers of the International Mechanical Code 2018 or where there is no corresponding Section in the code,



the following Sections shall be enacted as additions to the code.

Section 101.1 Insert: "City of Willard."

Delete Sections 103.1, 103.2 and 103.3 in their entirety and insert, in lieu thereof, the following statement:
"See Chapter 1 of the International Building Code .2018

Section 106.5.3. Delete the text and add the sentence to read as follows: "See Section 109.6 of the
International Building Code."

Delete the text of Section 108.4 in its entirety and add a new sentence which shall read as follows: "The
penalties are set forth in Section 500.150 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard."

Amend Section 108.5 by deleting the last sentence of that Section and adding, in lieu thereof, the following:
"Any person who shall continue any work on the system having been served with a stop work order, except
such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable for a
fine as prescribed in Section 500.150 of the Code of Ordinances of the City of Willard."

307.2.1 Condensate disposal. Condensate from all cooling coils and evaporators shall be conveyed from the drain-pan outlet
to an approved place of disposal. Such piping shall maintain a m inimum horizontal slope in the direction of discharge of not
less than one-eighth unit vertical in 12 units horizontal (1 percent slope). Condensate shall not discharge into a street, alley;

crawl space, or other areas to cause a nuisance.
502. 14 Motor vehicle operation,

Exception: 4. If it can be shown, subject to the approval of the code official having jurisdiction, that the area of
motor vehicle operation in an existing building was previously used as a motor vehicle operation area, a properly
listed and labeled exhaust hose not greater than eight (8) feet in length may be used, provided it is connected to the
vehicle while in operation and securely attached to a permanent opening through the exterior surface of the building.

506.3.2.5 Grease duct test. Prior to the use or concealment of any portion of a grease-duct system, a leakage test shall be
performed. Ducts shall be considered to be concealed where installed in shafts or covered by coating or wraps that prevent
the ductwork from being visually inspected on all sides. The permit holder shall be responsible to provide the necessary
equipment and perform the grease-duct-leakage test. The grease duct shall be tested by drawing a vacuum on or pressurizing
the installed, in place, grease duct to a minimum of 4 inches water column (995 pa, 0.144 psi). The test shall be witnessed by
the code official or the code official's duly authorized agent. The grease duct will pass inspection if the pressure or vacuum
applied holds for 15 minutes with zero leakage. Measurement shall be made with a digital manometer or pressure gauge with
an accuracy of 0.5 percent. The measurement device shall be connected to the test cover of the hood and duct connection and

shall be readily accessible for reading.

509.2 Domiestic Uses. Cooking appliances required by section 505.6 to have a domestic, cooking-exhaust system shall be
p